

EXHIBIT 3

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

Matter ID: 649
Client Sort: Boston
Description: City of Boston

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Current Rate</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
Dardarian, Linda	207.30	795.00	164,803.50
Wendell, Raymond	363.00	495.00	179,685.00
Fisher, Katharine	20.20	465.00	9,393.00
Grimes, Scott	93.40	255.00	23,817.00
Kirkpatrick, Stuart	203.90	225.00	45,877.50
Valdez, Damon	110.90	225.00	24,952.50
Total for this Matter and Date Range in Query:	998.70		448,528.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

Date	Professional	Narrative	Hours	Rate	Amount
03/09/2017	Dardarian, Linda	Review and comment on Open Record Act request	0.10	795.00	79.50
03/09/2017	Dardarian, Linda	Analyze case materials	0.20	795.00	159.00
03/09/2017	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re investigation	0.10	795.00	79.50
03/16/2017	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian re GoogleEarth review of Boston curb ramps	0.50	255.00	127.50
03/16/2017	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ S. Kirkpatrick re Boston curb ramps	0.30	255.00	76.50
03/16/2017	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian, A. Lee, R. Wendell, and S. Kirkpatrick re curb ramp violations tracking	0.50	255.00	127.50
03/16/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Research and chart public buildings and locations in preparation for curb ramp violation mapping project	4.30	225.00	967.50
03/16/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Conference with S. Grimes re: curb ramp violation mapping project	0.30	225.00	67.50
03/16/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Conference with legal team re: mapping project goals and naming conventions for coders	0.50	225.00	112.50
03/16/2017	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ S. Kirkpatrick, S. Grimes, R. Wendell, and A. Lee re same	0.50	795.00	397.50
03/17/2017	Valdez, Damon	Conference w/ S. Kirkpatrick and C. Trevino re GoogleEarth review of certain Boston streets	0.30	225.00	67.50
03/17/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Prepare naming convention chart and instructions for mapping coders	0.40	225.00	90.00
03/17/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Conference with D. Valdez and C. Trevino re: curb ramp mapping project	0.30	225.00	67.50
03/17/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Analyze and chart curb ramp violations	2.70	225.00	607.50
03/17/2017	Dardarian, Linda	Case investigation strategy	0.20	795.00	159.00
03/20/2017	Dardarian, Linda	Review case investigation materials	0.20	795.00	159.00
03/20/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Analyze and chart curb ramp violations	3.30	225.00	742.50
03/21/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Analyze and chart curb ramp violations	1.50	225.00	337.50
03/22/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Analyze curb ramp violation	0.60	225.00	135.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

03/22/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Conference with D. Valdez re: curb ramp violation mapping project procedures	0.20	225.00	45.00
03/22/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Analyze and chart curb ramp violations	0.30	225.00	67.50
03/22/2017	Valdez, Damon	Research re possible ADA violations of Boston streets	3.10	225.00	697.50
03/23/2017	Valdez, Damon	Research re possible ADA violations of Boston streets	2.40	225.00	540.00
03/24/2017	Valdez, Damon	Research re possible ADA violations of Boston streets	3.20	225.00	720.00
07/27/2017	Grimes, Scott	Phone call (partial) w/ L. Dardarian, R. Wendell, T. Fox, S. Eichner, and T. Murphy re case investigation	0.60	255.00	153.00
07/27/2017	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian and R. Wendell re same	0.20	255.00	51.00
07/27/2017	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ S. Grimes, R. Wendell, S. Eichner, T. Murphy and T. Fox re analysis of records provided in response to public record act request re Boston curb ramp and sidewalk access barriers	0.90	795.00	715.50
07/27/2017	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell and S. Grimes re same and identifying corners w/ non-compliant ramps	0.20	795.00	159.00
07/27/2017	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian, S. Grimes, T. Fox, S. Eichner, T. Murphy, and C. Hall re: analysis of documents received from City in response to public record request.	0.90	495.00	445.50
07/27/2017	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian and S. Grimes re: analysis of documents received from City in response to public record request.	0.20	495.00	99.00
07/27/2017	Grimes, Scott	Internet research re Boston policies re curb ramps request, curb ramp locations	2.30	255.00	586.50
07/28/2017	Grimes, Scott	Internet research re complaint procedures	1.90	255.00	484.50
07/31/2017	Grimes, Scott	Review street improvement database and curb ramp location web site	3.10	255.00	790.50
07/31/2017	Grimes, Scott	Phone call w/ T. Fox re research re curb missing ramp	0.70	255.00	178.50
08/02/2017	Grimes, Scott	Review memo re curb ramp database coding	0.20	255.00	51.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

08/02/2017	Grimes, Scott	Multiple emails with team re issues with curb ramp coding database	0.30	255.00	76.50
08/03/2017	Grimes, Scott	Emails w/ T. Fox re curb ramp coding database	0.10	255.00	25.50
08/07/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research re curb ramp violations and update database same	2.20	255.00	561.00
08/08/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research re curb ramp violations	1.30	255.00	331.50
08/09/2017	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ S. Grimes re analysis of curb ramps in Boston	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/09/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research re curb ramp violations and update database re same	5.70	255.00	1,453.50
08/09/2017	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian re same	0.10	255.00	25.50
08/10/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research re curb ramp violations and update database re same	2.80	255.00	714.00
08/11/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research re curb ramp violations and update database re same	3.30	255.00	841.50
08/14/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research curb ramp violations and update database re same	3.50	255.00	892.50
08/16/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research re curb ramp violations and update database re same	4.90	255.00	1,249.50
09/13/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research re missing/non-compliant curb ramps	4.60	255.00	1,173.00
09/14/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research re missing/non-compliant curb ramps	1.10	255.00	280.50
09/15/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research re missing/non-compliant curb ramps	1.90	255.00	484.50
09/22/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research re missing or non-compliant curb ramps	3.30	255.00	841.50
10/06/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research re curb ramp violations	1.50	255.00	382.50
10/09/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research potential curb ramp violations and update database re same	4.90	255.00	1,249.50
10/10/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research re potential curb ramp violations and update database re same	3.00	255.00	765.00
10/11/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review memo re from CREEC re project to review street ramps and code them for violations	0.50	225.00	112.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

10/11/2017	Valdez, Damon	Conference w/ S. Kirkpatrick re same	0.20	225.00	45.00
10/11/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	2.40	225.00	540.00
10/11/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research potential curb ramp violations and update database re same	4.10	255.00	1,045.50
10/12/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	6.80	225.00	1,530.00
10/12/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research potential curb ramp violations and update database re same	3.90	255.00	994.50
10/13/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	5.80	225.00	1,305.00
10/13/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research re curb ramp violations	1.60	255.00	408.00
10/16/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	6.20	225.00	1,395.00
10/16/2017	Valdez, Damon	Exchange emails w/ C. Hall re data review and coding project	0.20	225.00	45.00
10/17/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	6.10	225.00	1,372.50
10/18/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	6.40	225.00	1,440.00
10/18/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	2.30	225.00	517.50
10/19/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	6.30	225.00	1,417.50
10/19/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	5.90	225.00	1,327.50
10/19/2017	Grimes, Scott	Review potential curb ramp violations and update database re same	1.10	255.00	280.50
10/20/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	5.60	225.00	1,260.00
10/20/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	5.80	225.00	1,305.00
10/23/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	5.30	225.00	1,192.50
10/23/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	6.80	225.00	1,530.00
10/23/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research potential curb ramp violations	1.10	255.00	280.50
10/24/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	6.10	225.00	1,372.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

10/24/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	6.10	225.00	1,372.50
10/25/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	5.80	225.00	1,305.00
10/25/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	5.70	225.00	1,282.50
10/26/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	6.20	225.00	1,395.00
10/26/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	5.10	225.00	1,147.50
10/26/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research potential curb cut violations	2.10	255.00	535.50
10/27/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	4.40	225.00	990.00
10/27/2017	Grimes, Scott	Research potential curb cut violations	2.10	255.00	535.50
10/30/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	5.40	225.00	1,215.00
10/30/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	5.70	225.00	1,282.50
10/31/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	3.60	225.00	810.00
10/31/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	6.80	225.00	1,530.00
11/01/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	3.10	225.00	697.50
11/03/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	6.70	225.00	1,507.50
11/06/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	4.60	225.00	1,035.00
11/07/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	6.80	225.00	1,530.00
11/07/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	6.20	225.00	1,395.00
11/08/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	6.60	225.00	1,485.00
11/09/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	3.80	225.00	855.00
11/09/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	5.90	225.00	1,327.50
11/10/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	1.70	225.00	382.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

11/10/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	6.40	225.00	1,440.00
11/13/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	4.20	225.00	945.00
11/14/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	2.30	225.00	517.50
11/14/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	1.80	225.00	405.00
11/15/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	5.10	225.00	1,147.50
11/16/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	2.90	225.00	652.50
11/16/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	2.20	225.00	495.00
11/17/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	3.90	225.00	877.50
11/28/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	3.30	225.00	742.50
11/29/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	2.40	225.00	540.00
11/30/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	3.20	225.00	720.00
12/01/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	4.20	225.00	945.00
12/04/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	3.20	225.00	720.00
12/05/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	3.40	225.00	765.00
12/06/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	1.30	225.00	292.50
12/07/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	2.90	225.00	652.50
12/08/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	5.70	225.00	1,282.50
12/11/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	3.80	225.00	855.00
12/12/2017	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	5.10	225.00	1,147.50
12/14/2017	Valdez, Damon	Review city streets for ramp violations and update tracking database re same	2.30	225.00	517.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

01/04/2018	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	1.80	225.00	405.00
01/10/2018	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	4.80	225.00	1,080.00
01/11/2018	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review and chart curb ramp violations in CREEC database	4.40	225.00	990.00
01/25/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ S. Grimes re status of curb ramp investigation	0.10	795.00	79.50
01/25/2018	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian re status of curb ramp investigation	0.10	255.00	25.50
01/29/2018	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Conference call with T. Fox, L. Dardarian and S. Grimes re: curb ramp investigation status and results	0.40	225.00	90.00
01/29/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Fox, S. Kirkpatrick, S. Grimes re investigation of curb ramps barriers of Pedestrian Right of Way	0.40	795.00	318.00
01/29/2018	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ T. Fox, L. Dardarian and S. Kirkpatrick re status review of Boston curb ramps	0.40	255.00	102.00
02/01/2018	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian, R. Wendell, T. Fox S. Eichner, T. Murphy and R. Glassner re demand letter and case investigation	0.50	255.00	127.50
02/01/2018	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian, R. Wendell re demand letter and case investigation	0.20	255.00	51.00
02/01/2018	Grimes, Scott	Research re non-compliant curb ramps	0.80	255.00	204.00
02/01/2018	Grimes, Scott	Review Mass. regulations re curb ramp construction	0.30	255.00	76.50
02/01/2018	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy conference with L. Dardarian, S. Grimes, T. Fox, T. Murphy, R. Glassman, and S. Eichner re: data analysis and demand letter.	0.50	495.00	247.50
02/01/2018	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy conference with L. Dardarian, and S. Grimes re: data analysis and demand letter.	0.20	495.00	99.00
02/01/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Review state curb ramp regulations	0.10	795.00	79.50
02/01/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ S. Grimes re scope of violations found in pedestrian right of way	0.10	795.00	79.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

02/01/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Fox, R. Wendell, S. Grimes, S. Eichner and T. Murphy re data analysis and demand letter	0.50	795.00	397.50
02/01/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell and S. Grimes re same	0.20	795.00	159.00
02/01/2018	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Review curb ramp locations and screenshot examples of non-compliant curb ramp corners	0.60	225.00	135.00
02/01/2018	Grimes, Scott	Review City of Boston web site for capital spending plans	0.60	255.00	153.00
02/01/2018	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian re results of research re non-compliant curb ramps	0.10	255.00	25.50
02/13/2018	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian re demand letter preparation	0.30	255.00	76.50
03/06/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit demand letter	0.80	795.00	636.00
03/06/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Memo to T Fox for re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
03/19/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Memo to T. Fox re scope of claims	0.30	795.00	238.50
05/02/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit demand letter	1.10	795.00	874.50
05/03/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit demand letter	0.70	795.00	556.50
05/04/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Structured Negotiations Agreement	0.20	795.00	159.00
05/04/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Email T. Fox re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
05/08/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Review status of demand letter	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/18/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to T. Fox re status of negotiations	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/18/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Review evidence of violations	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/19/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to R. Wendell re draft complaint and defendant's unresponsiveness to demand letter	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/19/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Review City's sidewalk equity program and documents	0.20	795.00	159.00
07/09/2018	Wendell, Raymond	Meet and confer with L. Dardarian, M. Sun, T. Murphy, S. Eichner, T. Fox, and David Soares from City of Boston re: initial steps in settlement negotiations.	0.50	495.00	247.50
07/09/2018	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian and M. Sun debriefing on meet and confer call with City of Boston.	0.10	495.00	49.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

07/09/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for conference w/ City re structured negotiations and outline points for presentation	0.80	795.00	636.00
07/09/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Fox and S. Eichner re same	0.40	795.00	318.00
07/09/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell, M. Sun, T. Fox, T. Murphy, D. Soares and S. Eichner re same	0.50	795.00	397.50
07/09/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell and M. Sun re draft complaint and structured negotiations	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/02/2018	Wendell, Raymond	Edit draft complaint.	2.40	495.00	1,188.00
08/02/2018	Wendell, Raymond	Memorandum to M. Sun re: draft complaint.	0.20	495.00	99.00
09/24/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Fox re complaint and meeting w/ City	0.10	795.00	79.50
10/01/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Memos to and from T. Fox re proposed meeting w/ defendant and agenda for same	0.20	795.00	159.00
10/15/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Memos to and from T. Fox re meeting w/ clients and meeting w/ the City re negotiations	0.20	795.00	159.00
10/16/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Memos to and from T. Murphy re preparation for client meeting	0.20	795.00	159.00
10/18/2018	Valdez, Damon	Review and analyze re street and sidewalk improvements	0.20	225.00	45.00
10/18/2018	Valdez, Damon	Exchange emails w/ L. Dardarian re same	0.20	225.00	45.00
10/18/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for call w/ claimants and city attorneys re curb ramp negotiations	1.20	795.00	954.00
10/18/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ S. Eichner, T. Murphy, T. Fox, J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re structured negotiations, information we need to productive meeting, and elements of settlement agreement	0.50	795.00	397.50
10/18/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Memos to and from S. Eichner, T. Murphy, T. Fox re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
10/19/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to City re information necessary to prepare for in-person meeting	0.80	795.00	636.00
10/19/2018	Valdez, Damon	Exchange emails w/ L. Dardarian re documents needed for meeting w/ defendant	0.20	225.00	45.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

10/19/2018	Valdez, Damon	Analyze documents for attorney use and review at meeting w/ defendant	0.40	225.00	90.00
10/26/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman re information exchange	0.10	795.00	79.50
10/26/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for client call re meeting w/ the City	0.20	795.00	159.00
10/26/2018	Valdez, Damon	Analyze materials for L. Dardarian to review and use at meeting w/ defendant	0.90	225.00	202.50
10/26/2018	Valdez, Damon	Draft email to L. Dardarian re same.	0.10	225.00	22.50
10/29/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for call w/ clients re meeting w/ City	0.50	795.00	397.50
10/29/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Fox, T. Murphy, S. Eichner, C. Hall, C. Flanagan and M. Muehe re same	1.00	795.00	795.00
10/29/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Further prepare for meeting w/ Boston representatives	0.30	795.00	238.50
10/29/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Correspondences to and from the City and co-counsel re same	0.30	795.00	238.50
10/29/2018	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, S. Eichner, and clients M. Muehe, C. Evans, and C. Flanagan re: preparation for meeting with City.	1.00	495.00	495.00
10/30/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memos to T. Fox re debriefing meeting w/ City and follow up w/ City re information request	0.20	795.00	159.00
10/30/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Strategy re call w/ Boston	0.10	795.00	79.50
10/30/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Review documents produced by the City	0.30	795.00	238.50
10/31/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, T. Fox, T. Murphy and S. Eichner (for part) re information exchange and in person meeting	0.50	795.00	397.50
12/04/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Fox and T. Murphy re preparation for meeting w/ the City re curb ramps	0.30	795.00	238.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

12/05/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for meeting re curb ramp remediation - review documents from the City, prior correspondence, conversations, and outline presentation	6.90	795.00	5,485.50
12/06/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for meeting w/ City re curb ramp negotiations	0.80	795.00	636.00
12/06/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, K. Choe, K. McCash, C. Evans, M. Muehe, C. Flanagan, T. Fox, T. Murphy, S. Eichner re structured negotiations re curb ramp program	3.60	795.00	2,862.00
12/06/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
12/07/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit memo to the City re additional information needed for negotiations	0.40	795.00	318.00
12/17/2018	Dardarian, Linda	Correspondences to and from C. Evans re flooded ramps	0.10	795.00	79.50
01/09/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Memo to T. Murphy and T. Fox re information exchange for negotiations w/ Boston	0.40	795.00	318.00
03/04/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for call w/ co-counsel re negotiations and information from the City	0.30	795.00	238.50
03/04/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Fox, S. Eichner and T. Murphy re same S. Eichner for part)	1.00	795.00	795.00
03/04/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review materials from defendants and prior call dates, prepare outline for settlement call w/ the City	2.70	795.00	2,146.50
03/05/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, S. Eichner, C. Flanagan, K. Choe, J. Doonan, J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, and J. Emery re: Boston's systems for maintaining and inspecting the pedestrian right of way for disability access.	2.20	495.00	1,089.00
03/05/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for call w/ Boston re curb ramps	0.50	795.00	397.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

03/05/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ R. Wendell, T. Fox, T. Murphy S. Eichner, A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, Krista, Jessica, K. Choe, and J. Emery re City pedestrian right of way and jurisdiction, curb ramps requests, systems, snow removal, inspections and surveys of pedestrian right of way	2.20	795.00	1,749.00
03/05/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Follow up w/ T. Fox, T. Murphy, S. Eichner re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
03/07/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit memo to the City re follow up from meeting	0.50	795.00	397.50
03/25/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for 4/2 meeting w/ the City re curb ramps	0.40	795.00	318.00
04/01/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for meeting w/ City re curb ramps	0.50	795.00	397.50
04/02/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Travel to Boston for curb ramp meeting w/ City and prepare for same en route	4.00	795.00	3,180.00
04/02/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Fox, S. Eichner and T. Murphy to prepare for meeting w/ the City	0.50	795.00	397.50
04/02/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Meet w/ A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, K. Chao, Kristin, Jessica, T. Fox, S. Eichner and M. Muehe re curb ramp issues	1.60	795.00	1,272.00
04/02/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Debrief w/ S. Eichner and M. Muehe re same	0.30	795.00	238.50
04/02/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Travel from meeting w/ City	0.30	795.00	238.50
04/19/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to R. Wendell re draft curb ramp term sheet	0.50	795.00	397.50
04/19/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re same	0.20	795.00	159.00
04/19/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Conference w/ L. Dardarian re draft term sheet	0.20	495.00	99.00
04/22/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Draft settlement term sheet	6.20	495.00	3,069.00
04/23/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit plaintiffs' term sheet	1.20	795.00	954.00
05/10/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for negotiations w/ defendant	0.20	795.00	159.00
05/13/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for call w/ defendant re draft term sheet	0.60	795.00	477.00
05/13/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Fox, R. Wendell, T. Murphy re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
05/13/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, T. Fox, T. Murphy and R. Wendell re same	0.90	795.00	715.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

05/13/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to T. Murphy, T. Fox and R. Wendell re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
05/13/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy to prepare for call with the City re: term sheet.	0.10	495.00	49.50
05/13/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, and J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum from City of Boston re: Plaintiff's term sheet.	0.90	495.00	445.50
06/04/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review City's edits to term sheet	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/04/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to co-counsel re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/05/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for conference w/ defendants re terms of settlement	0.40	795.00	318.00
06/06/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Murphy and T. Fox to prepare for settlement conference w/ City attorneys	0.30	795.00	238.50
06/06/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ T. Murphy, T. Fox, J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re settlement terms and curb ramp survey	0.80	795.00	636.00
06/10/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re conference w/ Boston re settlement terms and drafting consent decree	0.20	795.00	159.00
06/10/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to R. Wendell re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/13/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to and from T. Murphy re status of negotiations	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/20/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ A. Lee re curb ramp survey costs and methodologies	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/27/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, and K. Choe re; curb ramp survey.	0.50	495.00	247.50
06/27/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian re: consent decree.	0.10	495.00	49.50
06/27/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Draft consent decree.	4.40	495.00	2,178.00
06/27/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ A. Lee re sidewalk and curb ramp surveys and parameters	0.50	795.00	397.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

06/27/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, K. Choe, T. Murphy, T. Fox and R. Wendell re curb ramp survey and request for production of documents	0.50	795.00	397.50
06/27/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re draft consent decree	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/27/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Strategy and research re settlement demand	0.50	795.00	397.50
06/27/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memos to T. Fox and T. Murphy re same	0.20	795.00	159.00
06/27/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to and from T. Murphy re City's financial information	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/28/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Draft consent decree.	3.40	495.00	1,683.00
07/02/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Draft consent decree.	2.40	495.00	1,188.00
07/05/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Draft consent decree.	4.20	495.00	2,079.00
07/08/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Draft consent decree.	6.40	495.00	3,168.00
07/09/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review City's historic and future budgets and funding sources for curb ramp and installations in preparation for negotiations (1.2)	1.20	795.00	954.00
07/10/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Meet and confer with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, M. Muehe, J. Lederman, and A. Cederbaum re: curb ramp settlement negotiations.	0.50	495.00	247.50
07/10/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Preparation for negotiation session with Boston (0.5). Lead conference with A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, T. Fox, T. Murphy, R. Wendell and M. Muehe re. curb ramp installation numbers (0.5). Follow up with R. Wendell re. same (0.2). Draft correspondence to the City re same (1.1).	2.20	795.00	1,749.00
07/15/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Draft consent decree.	3.50	495.00	1,732.50
07/17/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Edit draft consent decree.	2.20	495.00	1,089.00
07/29/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for conference w/ J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re curb ramp negotiations	0.40	795.00	318.00
07/29/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit consent decree	0.50	795.00	397.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

07/29/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ T. Fox, T. Murphy, J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re curb ramp negotiations	0.20	795.00	159.00
07/31/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ A. Lee re defendant's survey request for proposal	0.20	795.00	159.00
07/31/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Consent Decree	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/01/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit draft Consent Decree	4.60	795.00	3,657.00
08/02/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Consent Decree	2.20	495.00	1,089.00
08/02/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Memos to and from R. Wendell re Consent Decree terms	0.20	795.00	159.00
08/05/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review draft request for proposal for curb ramp survey, and draft correspondence to City re same	2.20	795.00	1,749.00
08/05/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re Consent Decree terms	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/05/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit revised draft of Consent Decree	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/05/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Consent Decree	1.10	495.00	544.50
08/06/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Finalize correspondence to Boston re curb ramp survey request for proposal	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/06/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit revised draft Consent Decree	0.80	795.00	636.00
08/06/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Memorandum to L. Dardarian re: City's draft request for proposals for curb ramp survey project.	0.30	495.00	148.50
08/07/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Finalize edit to Consent Decree	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/07/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Consent Decree	0.60	495.00	297.00
08/09/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review and respond to T. Fox re Consent Decree draft	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/12/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to R. Wendell re curb ramp slope measurement techniques	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/13/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit final draft of Consent Decree	0.60	795.00	477.00
08/21/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for settlement conference w/ the City	0.20	795.00	159.00
08/22/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for call w/ City re settlement terms	0.30	795.00	238.50
08/22/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Phone call with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re: draft Consent Decree	0.70	495.00	346.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

08/22/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Debrief with L. Dardarian re: phone call with City re: draft consent decree.	0.10	495.00	49.50
08/22/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Research re: attorneys' fees under prior, similar settlements.	0.40	495.00	198.00
08/22/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Memorandum to L. Dardarian, T. Fox and T. Murphy re: attorneys' fees under prior similar settlements.	0.30	495.00	148.50
08/22/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ T. Fox, T. Murphy, R. Wendell, A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman re Consent Decree terms	0.70	795.00	556.50
08/22/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/22/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for conference w/ City re settlement negotiations	0.30	795.00	238.50
08/28/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review and revise draft correspondence to Boston re comparable rates, plus research re same	0.60	795.00	477.00
09/21/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to R. Wendell re transition plan for pedestrian right of way	0.10	795.00	79.50
10/01/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Call with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum and J. Lederman re: Boston's response to draft Consent Decree	0.90	495.00	445.50
10/01/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for conference w/ Boston re curb ramp negotiations	0.40	795.00	318.00
10/01/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, Lederman and R. Wendell Boston's response to draft Consent Decree	0.90	795.00	715.50
10/01/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, R. Wendell, T. Fox and T. Murphy re City's response to plaintiffs' settlement proposal	0.90	795.00	715.50
10/08/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Strategy re settlement w/ T. Fox, T. Murphy and R. Wendell	0.50	795.00	397.50
10/08/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Follow up w/ R. Wendell re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
10/08/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for same	0.10	795.00	79.50
10/08/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian, T. Murphy, and T. Fox re: consent decree negotiations.	0.50	495.00	247.50
10/15/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review City's curb ramp offer	0.10	795.00	79.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

10/15/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review emails from T. Fox and T. Murphy re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
10/17/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell, T. Fox, T. Murphy re City's curb ramp offer and assumptions	0.20	795.00	159.00
10/17/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare counter proposal and talking points for call w/ City	0.50	795.00	397.50
10/17/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, R. Wendell, T. Fox and T. Murphy re same	0.70	795.00	556.50
10/17/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Follow up w/ R. Wendell re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
10/17/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy conference with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: settlement negotiations.	0.20	495.00	99.00
10/17/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Call with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, and J. Lederman re: draft Consent Decree	0.70	495.00	346.50
10/29/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of settlement.	4.30	495.00	2,128.50
10/30/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	3.00	495.00	1,485.00
11/01/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	4.50	495.00	2,227.50
11/04/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of settlement.	1.40	495.00	693.00
11/07/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Edit complaint.	1.80	495.00	891.00
11/08/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of settlement.	2.30	495.00	1,138.50
11/11/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re status of negotiations	0.10	795.00	79.50
11/13/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for negotiation session w/ the City	0.30	795.00	238.50
11/13/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, T. Fox, T. Murphy and R. Wendell re status of survey proposal, ADA coordinator hiring, negotiations re annual commitment, and Leadership change	0.50	795.00	397.50
11/13/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, and J. Lederman re: further settlement negotiations.	0.50	495.00	247.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

11/18/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review Stantec proposal re curb ramp survey	0.50	795.00	397.50
11/18/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review information re Stantec re curb ramp survey	0.20	795.00	159.00
11/19/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review survey proposal	0.20	795.00	159.00
11/19/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Fox, T. Murphy and R. Wendell re same	0.40	795.00	318.00
11/19/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re Stantec curb ramp survey proposal	2.50	795.00	1,987.50
11/20/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Call with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Lederman, J. Cederbaum, K. Choi, and J. Novella re: Stantec proposal for curb ramp survey.	0.70	495.00	346.50
11/20/2019	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Research and draft memo to L. Dardarian re detectable warning requirements	0.80	225.00	180.00
11/20/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, K. Choe, J. Novella, R. Wendell, T. Fox and T. Murphy re Stantec proposal and curb ramp negotiations	0.70	795.00	556.50
11/20/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ S. Kirkpatrick re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
11/20/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to T. Fox, T. Murphy and R. Wendell re same	0.20	795.00	159.00
11/20/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Research re same	0.20	795.00	159.00
11/21/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to the City re further issues w/ Stantec study	0.30	795.00	238.50
12/03/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, and K. Choe re: curb ramp survey and settlement negotiations.	0.40	495.00	198.00
12/03/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for conference w/ A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman and K. Chao re curb ramp negotiations	0.10	795.00	79.50
12/03/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, K. Chao, T. Fox, R. Wendell and T. Murphy re same	0.40	795.00	318.00
12/03/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Follow-up emails to and from co-counsel re same	0.10	795.00	79.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

12/03/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to S. Kirkpatrick re detectable warnings specifications	0.10	795.00	79.50
12/09/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Memos to and from T. Murphy re settlement status	0.10	795.00	79.50
12/09/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for conference w/ City re settlement, including reviewing detectable warning standards and regulations	0.30	795.00	238.50
12/10/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, K. Chao, T. Murphy, T. Fox and R. Wendell re curb ramp annual commitment, prioritization, survey request for production and feedback and Consent Decree	0.60	795.00	477.00
12/10/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Follow up email to T. Fox and T. Murphy re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
12/10/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Research re ADA solutions for detectible warnings	0.10	795.00	79.50
12/10/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian, T. Murphy, T. Fox, A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, and K. Choe re: annual commitment and curb ramp survey.	0.60	495.00	297.00
12/17/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review City's feedback on survey and prepare for meeting w/ Boston re settlement negotiations	0.90	795.00	715.50
12/17/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ A. Lee re same	0.20	795.00	159.00
12/18/2019	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, K. Choe, J. Lederman, and A. Cederbaum re: curb ramp survey and edits to consent decree.	0.30	495.00	148.50
12/18/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ K. Choe, J. Navarro, A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, T. Fox, T. Murphy and R. Wendell re Stantec proposal for pedestrian right of way survey and revisions to Consent Decree	0.30	795.00	238.50
12/29/2019	Dardarian, Linda	Review and comment on City's revisions to Consent Decree	1.10	795.00	874.50
01/02/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian and T. Fox re: City's edits to draft Consent Decree	0.80	495.00	396.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

01/02/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Investigate Boston's system for allowing citizens to request curb ramp repairs/report missing curb ramps.	2.40	495.00	1,188.00
01/02/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re City's edits to Consent Decree	0.10	795.00	79.50
01/02/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Memos to and from R. Wendell re curb ramp request system	0.20	795.00	159.00
01/02/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for call w/ City re Consent Decree terms	0.30	795.00	238.50
01/02/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell and T. Fox re same	0.80	795.00	636.00
01/03/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Call with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, J. Lederman, K. Choe, and John ? re: City's edits to the draft consent decree (partial).	1.50	495.00	742.50
01/03/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ J. Lederman, J. Navarro, K. Choe, T. Fox and R. Wendell re City's edits to consent decree	2.10	795.00	1,669.50
01/03/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for same	0.20	795.00	159.00
01/03/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re same	0.90	795.00	715.50
01/03/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to T. Fox, T. Murphy and R. Wendell re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
01/06/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Phone call to client C. Evans re: City's current 311 request system.	0.60	495.00	297.00
01/09/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for call w/ City re Consent Decree terms	0.80	795.00	636.00
01/10/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian, T. Murphy, and T. Fox re: City's proposed edits to consent decree.	0.70	495.00	346.50
01/10/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian re: City's proposed edits to consent decree and timing of new draft.	0.40	495.00	198.00
01/10/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Negotiate consent decree with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, and J. Navarro	1.10	495.00	544.50
01/10/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Fox, T. Murphy, R. Wendell re curb ramp negotiations, and City's revisions to Consent Decree	0.70	795.00	556.50
01/10/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re same	0.10	795.00	79.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

01/10/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, J. Navarro re same	1.10	795.00	874.50
01/10/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Strategy re curb ramp request system and Decree terms re same	0.30	795.00	238.50
01/10/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re same	0.30	795.00	238.50
01/15/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Consent Decree.	5.10	495.00	2,524.50
01/17/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Consent Decree and draft comments to City on City's edits that will be discussed in upcoming call	2.50	795.00	1,987.50
01/21/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re edits to consent decree	0.20	795.00	159.00
01/21/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Edit consent decree.	3.40	495.00	1,683.00
01/23/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiations with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, and J. Navarro re: next round of edits to draft Consent Decree.	0.90	495.00	445.50
01/23/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for call w/ Boston re disputed terms of consent decree	0.50	795.00	397.50
01/23/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ J. Lederman, John (LNU), A. Cederbaum, T. Fox, T. Murphy and R. Wendell re same	0.90	795.00	715.50
01/23/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re follow up re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
02/10/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re Consent Decree negotiations status	0.10	795.00	79.50
02/10/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
02/27/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re consent decree finalization and status of negotiations	0.10	795.00	79.50
02/28/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Legal research re fee awards in D. Mass. for settlement negotiations	0.50	795.00	397.50
03/02/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re status of negotiations	0.10	795.00	79.50
03/03/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Phone call to J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re status of Consent Decree negotiations	0.10	795.00	79.50
03/03/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ A. Cederbaum re same	0.40	795.00	318.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

03/03/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to team re same	0.20	795.00	159.00
03/03/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Follow up w/ co-counsel re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
03/05/2020	Valdez, Damon	Legal research re fee awards in D. Mass.	0.80	225.00	180.00
03/05/2020	Valdez, Damon	Draft memo to L. Dardarian re same	0.20	225.00	45.00
03/09/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Review and analyze City's edits to draft Consent Decree, and draft response re same	4.50	495.00	2,227.50
03/10/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to City re Consent Decree and memo to T. Murphy, T. Fox & R. Wendell re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
03/12/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Edit draft consent decree.	3.80	495.00	1,881.00
03/13/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review and analyze edits to consent decree.	0.60	795.00	477.00
03/13/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Edit draft consent decree.	2.40	495.00	1,188.00
03/16/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Strategize with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: settlement negotiation, edits to draft consent decree.	0.90	495.00	445.50
03/16/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with T. Fox, R. Wendell, & T. Murphy re City's edits to Consent Decree and our response to same	0.90	795.00	715.50
03/18/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Consent Decree.	2.70	495.00	1,336.50
03/19/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Edit consent decree.	2.80	495.00	1,386.00
03/19/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	1.00	495.00	495.00
03/23/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to R. Wendell re Consent Decree edits	0.20	795.00	159.00
03/23/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Edit draft consent decree.	2.40	495.00	1,188.00
03/30/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	1.40	495.00	693.00
04/13/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit revised draft Consent Decree	0.30	795.00	238.50
04/16/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Consent Decree	0.20	795.00	159.00
04/27/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Consent Decree (1.4); research and draft memo to T. Murphy and T. Fox re same (0.4)	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
04/28/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with T. Fox re negotiations strategy (0.1).	0.10	795.00	79.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

05/01/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman & A. Cederbaum re status of negotiations	0.40	795.00	318.00
05/04/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman & A. Cederbaum re status of negotiations (0.4).	0.40	795.00	318.00
05/11/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman re negotiations status.	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/03/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to City re status of settlement negotiations and research re same.	0.50	795.00	397.50
06/04/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Exchange correspondence w/ A. Cederbaum and J. Lederman re status of negotiations (0.3).	0.30	795.00	238.50
06/08/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re negotiations status	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/18/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review draft Consent Decree and status of negotiations.	0.40	795.00	318.00
06/19/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiation call with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, and J. Lederman.	0.80	495.00	396.00
06/19/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Preparation for conference with City re Consent Decree negotiations (0.1). Lead conference with R. Wendell, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman re same (0.8)	0.90	795.00	715.50
06/24/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review Consent Decree and curb ramp standards to preparation for call with the City re negotiations.	0.90	795.00	715.50
06/25/2020	Wendell, Raymond	(Partial) Settlement negotiation call with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, and J. Lederman.	1.20	495.00	594.00
06/25/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Lead review Consent Decree and status of ramp survey with A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, R. Wendell, T. Fox, T. Murphy (1.5); memo to R. Wendell, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re follow up re same (0.1); review prior negotiations history in preparation for same (0.3)	1.90	795.00	1,510.50
07/01/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian and T. Murphy re: edits to draft consent decree.	0.40	495.00	198.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

07/01/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review potential edits to Consent Decree (0.3). Conference with T. Murphy & R. Wendell re same (0.4). Review pedestrian right of way survey tool for completeness (0.1).	0.80	795.00	636.00
07/02/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Consent Decree (1.0); draft correspondence to the City re pedestrian of right of way survey items missing from Stantec inventory (0.5)	1.50	795.00	1,192.50
07/06/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Consent Decree and draft memo to the City re same.	0.20	795.00	159.00
07/14/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Negotiation with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, and J. Lederman re: consent decree.	1.10	495.00	544.50
07/14/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: settlement negotiations.	0.40	495.00	198.00
07/14/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Preparation for conference with the City re consent decree terms and curb ramp survey (0.4); lead conference with T. Fox, T. Murphy, R. Wendell, A. Cederbaum and J. Lederman re survey metrics and Consent Decree terms (1.1); strategy with T. Fox, T. Murphy, and R. Wendell re negotiations re curb ramp request system and maintenance (0.4); draft correspondence to J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re alterations to pedestrian right of way (0.1)	2.00	795.00	1,590.00
07/15/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to the City re alterations that trigger curb ramp installations.	0.70	795.00	556.50
07/23/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiations with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, J. Lederman, and A. Cederbaum.	1.40	495.00	693.00
07/23/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, R. Wendell, T. Murphy and T. Fox re Consent Decree negotiations (1.4); prepare for same (0.4)	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
07/31/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Consent Decree	0.10	795.00	79.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

08/03/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit consent decree.	1.40	795.00	1,113.00
08/04/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit consent decree.	0.40	795.00	318.00
08/05/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Revise Decree and draft correspondence to J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re Consent Decree negotiations (0.3).	0.30	795.00	238.50
08/17/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review City edits to Consent Decree and draft memo to A. Cedarbaum and J. Lederman in response.	0.20	795.00	159.00
08/19/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review status of negotiations (0.2); lead conference with T. Murphy, J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, T. Murphy and R. Wendell re Consent Decree negotiations and curb ramp survey (0.4); draft memo to T. Fox re same (0.3).	0.90	795.00	715.50
08/19/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiation with L. Dardarian, T. Murphy, J. Lederman, and A. Cederbaum.	0.40	495.00	198.00
09/18/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiations with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, and J. Lederman.	1.10	495.00	544.50
09/18/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Preparation for negotiation with City and outline points for same (0.7). Lead conference with J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, T. Fox, R. Wendell and T. Murphy re Consent Decree terms, survey status and annual commitment (1.1).	1.80	795.00	1,431.00
09/18/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re ramps by private developers (0.1). Draft memo to T. Fox and T. Murphy re annual commitment and settlement strategy (0.2).	0.30	795.00	238.50
09/21/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman & A. Cederbaum re survey data.	0.20	795.00	159.00
09/25/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Preparation for negotiations re City's revised annual commitment proposal and draft memo to T. Fox re same.	1.00	795.00	795.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

09/25/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to A. Cedar and J. Lederman re status of curb ramp survey.	0.10	795.00	79.50
09/28/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiations with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, J. Lederman, and A. Cederbaum.	0.40	495.00	198.00
09/28/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference with J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, T. Fox, T. Murphy and R. Wendell re counter-proposal for annual commitment (0.4); review and edit draft Consent Decree re annual commitment and meet and confer provisions for same (2.5).	2.90	795.00	2,305.50
09/29/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Edit Consent Decree and draft memo to co-counsel re same (0.5); draft memo to City re same (0.1).	0.60	795.00	477.00
09/29/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Review edits to draft consent decree.	0.30	495.00	148.50
10/15/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference with A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, T. Fox, R. Wendell and T. Murphy re curb ramp commitment (0.4); preparation for same (0.4).	0.80	795.00	636.00
10/15/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiations with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, J. Lederman, and A. Cederbaum.	0.40	495.00	198.00
10/15/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Review Boston's edits to Consent Decree.	0.50	495.00	247.50
10/21/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review City's edits to draft agreement and draft memo to co-counsel re same	0.10	795.00	79.50
10/23/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Review edits to Consent Decree.	0.50	495.00	247.50
10/23/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Strategy re settlement (0.1); draft memo to R. Wendell, T. Murphy and T. Fox re same (0.4).	0.50	795.00	397.50
10/25/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to City re revisions of Consent Decree, and revise same.	0.50	795.00	397.50
10/26/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference with R. Wendell, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum and J. Lederman re consent decree and annual commitment.	0.50	795.00	397.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

10/26/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiations with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, J. Lederman, and A. Cederbaum.	0.50	495.00	247.50
10/26/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Conference with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum and J. Lederman re Consent Decree negotiations	0.50	495.00	247.50
11/04/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence with A. Cederbaum and J. Lederman re status of negotiations.	0.10	795.00	79.50
11/05/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Preparation for conference with City re claimant payments (0.3). Lead conference with A. Cederbaum and J. Lederman re same (0.4). Memo to K. Burzynski re same (0.1). Conference with K. Burzynski re same (0.2).	1.00	795.00	795.00
11/10/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman & A. Cederbaum re damages for named plaintiffs.	2.30	795.00	1,828.50
11/17/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Preparation for conference with the City re Plaintiff damages claims (0.1). Lead conference with J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, T. Fox and T. Murphy re same (0.5). Strategy and research re fee demand	2.80	795.00	2,226.00
11/17/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to City re Plaintiffs' "ballpark" fees.	1.00	795.00	795.00
11/24/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian re: attorneys' fee demand letter.	0.20	495.00	99.00
11/24/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with R. Wendell re fee negotiations (0.2). Draft memo to R. Wendell re same (0.2).	0.40	795.00	318.00
11/25/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Draft attorneys' fees demand letter.	2.30	495.00	1,138.50
11/25/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memos to R. Wendell re fee negotiations.	0.20	795.00	159.00
11/30/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Draft attorneys' fees demand letter.	3.20	495.00	1,584.00
12/01/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiations with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, and J. Lederman re: class representative damages and attorneys' fees.	0.60	495.00	297.00
12/01/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Draft attorneys' fees demand letter.	3.00	495.00	1,485.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
12/01/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Preparation for conference w/ City re fees and damages (0.2). Lead conference with A. Cederbaum & J. Lederman re damages and fee negotiations (0.5). Draft memos to R. Wendell, T. Murphy and T. Fox re same (0.2).	0.90	795.00	715.50
12/02/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Draft attorneys' fees demand letter.	2.20	495.00	1,089.00
12/03/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Draft attorneys' fees demand letter to City.	5.20	495.00	2,574.00
12/10/2020	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Fact research for R. Wendell re market rates for plaintiffs' fee request and draft memo re same	1.50	225.00	337.50
12/11/2020	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Additional fact research and drafting memo to R. Wendell re market rates for plaintiffs' fee request	0.80	225.00	180.00
12/14/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Draft attorneys' fees demand letter to City.	7.20	495.00	3,564.00
12/15/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to R. Wendell re fee demand (0.2). Review and edit correspondence to the City re attorneys' fee claim (1.0).	1.20	795.00	954.00
12/15/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Draft attorneys' fees demand letter to City.	6.30	495.00	3,118.50
12/16/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Edit attorneys' fees demand letter to City.	2.40	495.00	1,188.00
12/16/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit correspondence to Defendants re fee demand.	0.40	795.00	318.00
12/16/2020	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to the City re status of negotiations (0.1). Draft memo to R. Wendell re same (0.1).	0.20	795.00	159.00
12/17/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Edit attorneys' fees demand letter to City.	1.70	495.00	841.50
12/18/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Memoranda to and from L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: attorneys' fees demand letter.	0.40	495.00	198.00
12/18/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Edit attorneys' fees demand letter.	0.70	495.00	346.50
12/21/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	1.80	495.00	891.00
12/22/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize attorneys' fees demand letter to City's counsel.	1.80	495.00	891.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

12/23/2020	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	7.00	495.00	3,465.00
01/05/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare evidence in support of fee petition	1.50	795.00	1,192.50
01/08/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiations with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, and J. Lederman re: attorneys' fees.	0.80	495.00	396.00
01/08/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Debrief with L. Dardarian re: City's response to attorneys' fees demand letter.	0.20	495.00	99.00
01/08/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell re City's response to plaintiffs' fee proposal	0.20	795.00	159.00
01/15/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to City re Plaintiffs.' fee demand.	2.90	795.00	2,305.50
01/19/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft, review, and edit correspondence to City re fee negotiations.	2.20	795.00	1,749.00
02/01/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review correspondence from City re fee negotiations (0.1). Draft correspondence to A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, T. Murphy and T. Fox re same (0.1).	0.20	795.00	159.00
02/02/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman & A. Cederbaum re negotiations (0.1). Strategy and draft new consent decree language(0.6).	0.70	795.00	556.50
02/16/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to A. Cederbaum and J. Lederman re status of negotiations.	0.10	795.00	79.50
02/22/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Phone call to A. Cederbaum & J. Lederman re status of negotiations (0.1). Draft memo to same re same (0.1). Propose alternative fee language for settlement (0.1).	0.30	795.00	238.50
02/23/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to A. Cederbaum and J. Lederman re status of negotiations and edits to Consent Decree (0.3).	0.30	795.00	238.50
02/25/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Correspondence to and from J. Lederman re negotiations.	0.10	795.00	79.50
03/03/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiations with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, and J. Lederman re: attorneys' fees, survey.	0.70	495.00	346.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
03/03/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Preparation for conference with the City re fee negotiations (0.2). Lead conference with J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, T. Murphy, R. Wendell and T. Fox re finalizing consent decree fee negotiations (0.7).	0.90	795.00	715.50
03/17/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiations with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, and J. Lederman re: attorneys' fees, survey.	0.50	495.00	247.50
03/17/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	0.90	495.00	445.50
03/17/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Preparation for call with City re finalizing negotiations (0.1). Lead conference with J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, T. Fox, T. Murphy and drw re same (0.5). Strategy re follow-up (0.2).	0.80	795.00	636.00
03/18/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	4.40	495.00	2,178.00
03/19/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: attorneys' fees petition, monitoring fees proposal.	0.50	495.00	247.50
03/19/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	2.40	495.00	1,188.00
03/19/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with T. Fox, T. Murphy, and R. Wendell re fee negotiation strategy (0.5). Draft correspondence to City re same and revise Consent Decree re same (0.5).	1.00	795.00	795.00
03/22/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	6.90	495.00	3,415.50
03/23/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	6.50	495.00	3,217.50
03/23/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Consent Decree and draft correspondence to City re same	0.70	795.00	556.50
03/24/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Consent Decree and draft correspondence to City re same	0.70	795.00	556.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

03/25/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit draft complaint, and draft memo to R. Wendell re same	1.00	795.00	795.00
03/26/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Memorandum to L. Dardarian re: draft complaint.	0.40	495.00	198.00
03/26/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit complaint.	1.20	495.00	594.00
03/26/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit preliminary approval briefing	1.00	795.00	795.00
03/26/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to R. Wendell re class notice and class counsel declaration	0.20	795.00	159.00
03/29/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiations with L. Dardarian, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, and J. Lederman re: attorneys' fees, survey.	0.80	495.00	396.00
03/29/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	1.40	495.00	693.00
03/29/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft memorandum to T. Fox and T. Murphy re: preliminary approval process.	0.80	495.00	396.00
03/29/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference w/ J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, T. Fox, T. Murphy and R. Wendell re Consent Decree negotiations and preliminary approval	0.80	795.00	636.00
03/29/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Prepare for same	0.20	795.00	159.00
03/30/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Correspondence to the City re dispute resolution fees	0.50	795.00	397.50
03/30/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Revise Consent Decree re current status of terms and fees provisions	0.30	795.00	238.50
03/31/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: fee provisions for monitoring and dispute resolution.	0.50	495.00	247.50
03/31/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Consent Decree	0.60	495.00	297.00
03/31/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Memoranda to and from L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: dispute resolution fees.	0.40	495.00	198.00
03/31/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit correspondence to defendants re monitoring fees	0.40	795.00	318.00
03/31/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Murphy, R. Wendell and T. Fox re same	0.40	795.00	318.00
03/31/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Revise Consent Decree re same	0.10	795.00	79.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

04/01/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Revise correspondence to City re Consent Decree and fees	0.10	795.00	79.50
04/05/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review Access Board update on pedestrian right of way access standards	0.20	795.00	159.00
04/07/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to R. Wendell regarding fee negotiations	0.10	795.00	79.50
04/08/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Preparation for conference w/ City regarding Consent Decree (0.2). Lead conference with A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, R. Wendell, T. Fox, and T. Murphy regarding same (0.6).	0.80	795.00	636.00
04/08/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Strategy regarding next steps in negotiations with T. Fox, T. Murphy and R. Wendell (.4)	0.40	795.00	318.00
04/08/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to A. Cederbaum and J. Lederman regarding same	1.10	795.00	874.50
04/08/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiations with L. Dardarian, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, and J. Lederman re: attorneys' fees, monitoring.	0.60	495.00	297.00
04/08/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: settlement negotiations (attorneys' fees and monitoring).	0.40	495.00	198.00
04/09/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Revise correspondence to City regarding Consent Decree negotiations	0.10	795.00	79.50
04/12/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft notice of class action settlement.	1.40	495.00	693.00
04/13/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review City's edits to consent decree	0.10	795.00	79.50
04/13/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with T. Fox, T. Murphy, and R. Wendell regarding same	0.20	795.00	159.00
04/13/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with co-counsel, A. Cederbaum and J. Lederman regarding same	0.80	795.00	636.00
04/13/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to R. Wendell regarding class notice	0.10	795.00	79.50
04/13/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: fee provisions for monitoring and dispute resolution.	0.20	495.00	99.00
04/13/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Settlement negotiations with L. Dardarian, T. Murphy, A. Cederbaum, and J. Lederman re: attorneys' fees, monitoring.	0.80	495.00	396.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

04/14/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Revise Consent Decree and draft memo to city regarding same	1.20	795.00	954.00
04/16/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft notice of class action settlement.	5.00	495.00	2,475.00
04/26/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft class notice.	3.40	495.00	1,683.00
04/26/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft proposed order granting preliminary approval of class action settlement.	1.50	495.00	742.50
04/27/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit notice of class action settlement.	0.40	495.00	198.00
04/27/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit class notice	0.60	795.00	477.00
04/27/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and respond to correspondence from City regarding final edits to Consent Decree, and review edits	0.10	795.00	79.50
04/27/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to Co-counsel regarding same	0.10	795.00	79.50
04/28/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and respond to email regarding class notice distribution	0.10	795.00	79.50
04/28/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to R. Wendell re finalizing Consent Decree	0.10	795.00	79.50
04/28/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Cleanup edits to Consent Decree.	2.90	495.00	1,435.50
04/29/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Cleanup edits to Consent Decree.	2.20	495.00	1,089.00
04/30/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Memoranda to and from L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: preparing to file complaint, motion for preliminary approval.	1.20	495.00	594.00
04/30/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Cleanup edits to Consent Decree.	0.60	495.00	297.00
05/03/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Research and draft memo to L. Dardarian re community outreach re curb ramp settlements	0.40	225.00	90.00
05/03/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum and T. Fox regarding finalizing consent decree, exhibits, and approval process	0.60	795.00	477.00
05/03/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to T. Murphy, R. Wendell, and T. Fox regarding same	0.10	795.00	79.50
05/03/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memos to R. Wendell and S. Kirkpatrick regarding joint statement regarding settlement	0.20	795.00	159.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

05/04/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Consent Decree exhibits and draft email to T. Fox, T. Murphy and R. Wendell regarding same	0.30	795.00	238.50
05/04/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy re: timeline for obtaining court approval of settlement.	2.40	495.00	1,188.00
05/04/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with T. Fox and T. Murphy re: preparing to file complaint and motion for preliminary approval.	0.50	495.00	247.50
05/04/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft memorandum to L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: timeline for obtaining court approval of settlement.	1.40	495.00	693.00
05/04/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft memorandum to L. Dardarian re: list of specific locations with missing or noncompliant curb ramps.	0.60	495.00	297.00
05/04/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Correspondence with J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re: edits to consent decree, class notice, and complaint.	0.50	495.00	247.50
05/04/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement and supporting documents	2.00	495.00	990.00
05/05/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement and proposed orders.	2.10	495.00	1,039.50
05/06/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft proposed order granting final approval of class action settlement and entering final judgment.	1.90	495.00	940.50
05/07/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Consent Decree exhibits	0.90	795.00	715.50
05/10/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft memorandum to L. Dardarian re: proposed schedule for settlement approval, notice process, and attorneys' fees briefing.	2.30	495.00	1,138.50
05/11/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit proposed order granting preliminary approval of class action settlement.	0.80	495.00	396.00
05/11/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit order granting final approval of class action settlement and final judgment.	0.50	495.00	247.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

05/11/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft memorandum to T. Fox and T. Murphy re: schedule for settlement approval, notice process, and attorneys' fees briefing.	0.80	495.00	396.00
05/14/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft memorandum to L. Dardarian re: finalizing consent decree, complaint, and preliminary approval motion.	0.30	495.00	148.50
05/14/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft Declaration of Linda M. Dardarian in Support of Motion for Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement.	3.20	495.00	1,584.00
05/17/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft correspondence to City re: edits to consent decree.	0.40	495.00	198.00
05/17/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review final edits to Consent Decree, exhibits and draft memo to R. Wendell re same	0.20	795.00	159.00
05/18/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review final edits to consent decree and exhibits, and draft memo to R. Wendell regarding same.	0.20	795.00	159.00
05/18/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Preparation for conference with the City regarding finalizing Consent Decree	0.10	795.00	79.50
05/18/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference with A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, T. Murphy, T. Fox, and R. Wendell regarding finalizing Consent Decree	0.40	795.00	318.00
05/18/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with R. Wendell regarding same and preliminary approval briefing	0.20	795.00	159.00
05/18/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Negotiations with A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: finalizing consent decree and submitting for court approval.	0.40	495.00	198.00
05/18/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian re: finalizing consent decree and submitting for court approval.	0.20	495.00	99.00
05/19/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review edits to Preliminary Approval Motion	0.20	795.00	159.00
05/19/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	3.20	495.00	1,584.00
05/19/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Memoranda to and from L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	1.10	495.00	544.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

05/19/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft Declaration of Linda M. Dardarian in Support of Motion for Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement.	0.50	495.00	247.50
05/20/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit preliminary approval motion	0.20	795.00	159.00
05/20/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Motion for Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement.	0.60	495.00	297.00
05/20/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Correspondence with City re: Joint Motion for Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement.	0.40	495.00	198.00
05/20/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize Consent Decree.	0.30	495.00	148.50
05/20/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize Complaint.	0.50	495.00	247.50
05/21/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Cite check and edit Complaint for R. Wendell	1.80	225.00	405.00
05/21/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft memorandum to S. Grimes and S. Kirkpatrick re: finalizing complaint.	0.30	495.00	148.50
05/21/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft Declaration of Linda M. Dardarian in Support of Motion for Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement.	4.00	495.00	1,980.00
05/21/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft declaration of Michael Muehe in Support of Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement.	1.40	495.00	693.00
05/21/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft joint motion to exceed page limit for motion for preliminary approval.	1.10	495.00	544.50
05/21/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit L. Dardarian declaration in support of Preliminary Approval	0.60	795.00	477.00
05/21/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review motion for leave to exceed page limit	0.10	795.00	79.50
05/21/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Plaintiff declarations in support of preliminary approval	0.20	795.00	159.00
05/21/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review evidence in support of fee petition	0.40	795.00	318.00
05/25/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft declaration of Elaine Hamilton in Support of Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement.	0.70	495.00	346.50
05/25/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft declaration of Crystal Evans in Support of Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement.	0.60	495.00	297.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

05/25/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft declaration of Colleen Flanagan in Support of Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement.	0.70	495.00	346.50
05/25/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Declaration of Linda M. Dardarian in Support of Motion for Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement.	1.20	495.00	594.00
05/25/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Negotiations with A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: finalizing consent decree and submitting for court approval.	0.20	495.00	99.00
05/25/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian re: finalizing consent decree and submitting for court approval.	0.20	495.00	99.00
05/25/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit list of organizational recipients of class notice (Exhibit D to Consent Decree).	0.70	495.00	346.50
05/25/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft memorandum to T. Fox and T. Murphy re: finalizing complaint and motion for preliminary approval.	0.40	495.00	198.00
05/25/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference with J. Lederman, T. Fox, T. Murphy, R. Wendell, and A. Cederbaum regarding finalizing Consent Decree	0.20	795.00	159.00
05/25/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with R. Wendell regarding same and Motion for preliminary approval	0.20	795.00	159.00
05/26/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Consent Decree.	0.50	495.00	247.50
05/26/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review pleadings for filing complaint, draft memo to S. Grimes and S. Kirkpatrick regarding same	0.10	795.00	79.50
05/26/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review City edits to Decree and exhibits, draft memo to team regarding same	0.30	795.00	238.50
05/26/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Draft Pro Hac Vice motions for L. Dardarian and R. Wendell admission to District of Massachusetts	0.50	225.00	112.50
06/01/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference with J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, T. Fox, and R. Wendell regarding finalizing consent Decree and Motion for Preliminary approval	0.40	795.00	318.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

06/01/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with R. Wendell regarding finalizing consent Decree and Motion for Preliminary approval	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/01/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Revise Consent Decree and finalize exhibits	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/01/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to T. Murphy regarding declarations in support of preliminary approval	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/01/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Negotiations with A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: finalizing consent decree and submitting for court approval.	0.40	495.00	198.00
06/01/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Debrief with L. Dardarian re: finalizing consent decree and submitting for court approval.	0.10	495.00	49.50
06/03/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Revise pleadings, Complaint, cover sheet and summons	0.60	795.00	477.00
06/03/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and comment on proposed ADA coordinator's qualifications.	0.40	795.00	318.00
06/08/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit class rep declarations	0.30	795.00	238.50
06/08/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to T. Murphy regarding same	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/08/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Research re curb ramp installation request system response times and draft memo to L. Dardarian re same	0.30	225.00	67.50
06/10/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Preparation for conference with Defendant regarding status of Consent Decree and approval papers	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/11/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Analyze and forward Duffy and Fox Preliminary Approval declarations from prior curb ramp cases to L. Dardarian	0.10	225.00	22.50
06/11/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Negotiations with A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: finalizing consent decree and submitting for court approval.	0.50	495.00	247.50
06/11/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian re: finalizing consent decree and moving for court approval.	0.30	495.00	148.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

06/11/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Lead conference with J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, T. Fox, T. Murphy, and R. Wendell re Consent Decree and Preliminary Approval Motion	0.50	795.00	397.50
06/11/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with R. Wendell regarding Consent Decree and Preliminary Approval Motion	0.20	795.00	159.00
06/11/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Memos to and from T. Murphy regarding Consent Decree and Preliminary Approval Motion	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/11/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to R. Wendell regarding materials in support of class certification	0.20	795.00	159.00
06/14/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Memos to and from R. Wendell regarding finalizing Consent Decree and preliminary approval papers	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/15/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Finalize Consent Decree and draft email to R. Wendell regarding same	0.20	795.00	159.00
06/16/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Memos to and from T. Fox regarding fee petition	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/17/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Negotiations with A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: finalizing Consent Decree and submitting for court approval.	0.50	495.00	247.50
06/17/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: finalizing Consent Decree and submitting for court approval.	0.30	495.00	148.50
06/17/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Consent Decree	0.30	495.00	148.50
06/17/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Complaint	0.20	495.00	99.00
06/17/2021	Grimes, Scott	Create accessible version of Consent Decree	0.90	255.00	229.50
06/17/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, T. Fox, T. Murphy and R. Wendell re complaint filing, Consent Decree finalization	0.50	795.00	397.50
06/17/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ T. Murphy, R. Wendell and T. Fox re same	0.20	795.00	159.00
06/17/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft joint press release at City's request	0.40	795.00	318.00
06/18/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit draft joint press release.	0.90	495.00	445.50
06/18/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft press release, at City's request	0.40	795.00	318.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

06/18/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit declarations in support of preliminary approval motion	0.30	795.00	238.50
06/22/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Phone call with C. Evans re preliminary approval declaration	0.20	495.00	99.00
06/22/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Phone call with C. Flanagan re preliminary approval declaration	0.20	495.00	99.00
06/23/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to team regarding finalizing Consent Decree	0.10	795.00	79.50
06/24/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Conference with L. Dardarian, R. Wendell, and S. Grimes re: Complaint and preliminary approval filings	0.60	225.00	135.00
06/24/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Fact cite-check and edit preliminary approval brief	2.80	225.00	630.00
06/24/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Edit client preliminary approval declarations	0.40	225.00	90.00
06/24/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Prepare L. Dardarian declaration exhibits	0.40	225.00	90.00
06/24/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Negotiations with A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: finalizing consent decree and submitting for court approval.	0.40	495.00	198.00
06/24/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian, S. Grimes, and S. Kirkpatrick re: filing of complaint and motion for preliminary approval.	0.60	495.00	297.00
06/24/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit motion for preliminary approval.	2.20	495.00	1,089.00
06/24/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize declaration of Linda M. Dardarian in support of motion for preliminary approval.	0.40	495.00	198.00
06/24/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize declaration of T. Fox in support of motion for preliminary approval.	0.30	495.00	148.50
06/24/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize declaration of T. Murphy in support of motion for preliminary approval.	0.20	495.00	99.00
06/24/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize declaration of M. Muehe in support of motion for preliminary approval.	0.20	495.00	99.00
06/24/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize declaration of C. Evans in support of motion for preliminary approval.	0.40	495.00	198.00
06/24/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize declaration of C. Flanagan in support of motion for preliminary approval.	0.20	495.00	99.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

06/24/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize declaration of E. Hamilton in support of motion for preliminary approval.	0.20	495.00	99.00
06/24/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit unopposed motion to file brief in excess of 20 pages.	0.50	495.00	247.50
06/24/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft memorandum to J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re: unopposed motion to file brief in excess of 20 pages.	0.20	495.00	99.00
06/24/2021	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian, R. Wendell, S. Kirkpatrick re Complaint, and motion for preliminary approval	0.60	255.00	153.00
06/24/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with A. Cederbaum, J. Lederman, T. Fox, and R. Wendell regarding finalizing Consent Decree and preliminary approval papers.	0.40	795.00	318.00
06/24/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with R. Wendell, S. Grimes and S. Kirkpatrick regarding same and complaint filing	0.60	795.00	477.00
06/25/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Legal cite-check and edit Preliminary Approval brief	3.60	225.00	810.00
06/25/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize declaration of Linda M. Dardarian in support of motion for preliminary approval.	0.30	495.00	148.50
06/25/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft memorandum to T. Fox and T. Murphy re: finalizing motion for preliminary approval.	0.40	495.00	198.00
06/25/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit motion for preliminary approval.	1.10	495.00	544.50
06/28/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Negotiation with J. Lederman, A. Cederbaum, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: finalizing filings, joint press release.	0.20	495.00	99.00
06/28/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	2.20	495.00	1,089.00
06/29/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize Consent Decree	0.60	495.00	297.00
06/30/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Correspondence w/ Elaine Hamilton re declaration	0.10	225.00	22.50
06/30/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Revise Preliminary Approval case filing documents	0.30	225.00	67.50
06/30/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Place calls to Elaine Hamilton re Consent Decree and Preliminary Approval declaration	0.20	225.00	45.00
06/30/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Phone calls with E. Hamilton re: consent decree and declaration	0.60	495.00	297.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

06/30/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement.	0.70	495.00	346.50
07/01/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Phone call and email exchange with Elaine Hamilton re Consent Decree and Preliminary Approval declaration	0.20	225.00	45.00
07/01/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Phone calls with E. Hamilton re: consent decree and declaration	0.50	495.00	247.50
07/01/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Memoranda to and from T. Fox and T. Murphy re press re settlement	0.60	495.00	297.00
07/01/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Conference w/ reporter re settlement	0.20	495.00	99.00
07/01/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Correspondence with A. Cederbaum and J. Lederman re: press inquiries.	0.20	495.00	99.00
07/02/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Email Defense counsel to notify of plan to file Preliminary Approval filing today, based on receipt of final Consent Decree signature	0.10	225.00	22.50
07/02/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Analyze District of Massachusetts local rules and standing orders re filing Complaint, motion and Consent Decree w/ Court	0.30	225.00	67.50
07/02/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Finalize Joint Motion for Preliminary Approval for filing w/ Court	2.40	225.00	540.00
07/02/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Email and call court clerk to confirm preferred courtesy copy format for Preliminary approval hard copies	0.10	225.00	22.50
07/06/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and respond to email regarding final approval hearing	0.20	795.00	159.00
07/07/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Phone call to A. Cederbaum regarding preliminary approval, and phone call to J. Lederman regarding same	0.10	795.00	79.50
07/07/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with J. Lederman regarding same and draft memo to co-counsel regarding same	0.10	795.00	79.50
07/08/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman regarding City's notices of appearance	0.10	795.00	79.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

07/08/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Phone call to court clerk regarding final approval hearing, and draft correspondence to City and Co-counsel regarding same	0.10	795.00	79.50
07/12/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to R. Wendell re preliminary approval	0.10	795.00	79.50
07/12/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to S. Kirkpatrick regarding notice issuance	0.10	795.00	79.50
07/12/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft outreach to community re: preliminary approval of settlement.	0.40	495.00	198.00
07/12/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft outreach to community re preliminary approval of settlement.	0.20	495.00	99.00
07/13/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft web page for GBDH website re: case and settlement, per preliminary approval order.	1.10	495.00	544.50
07/13/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Review and edit announcement to community re settlement.	0.60	495.00	297.00
07/13/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Memoranda to and from L. Dardarian re same	0.20	495.00	99.00
07/13/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	3.20	495.00	1,584.00
07/13/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit community outreach memos regarding settlement	0.10	795.00	79.50
07/14/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Prepare class notice for distribution to organizations	0.50	225.00	112.50
07/14/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Exchange emails with R. Wendell and T. Murphy re: contact information for the 60 organizations listed in Exhibit D of the Consent Decree	0.20	225.00	45.00
07/15/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Exchange emails with G. Chakraborty re: distribution of notice to organizations listed in Ex. D of Consent Decree	0.20	225.00	45.00
07/15/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memos to R. Wendell and S. Kirkpatrick regarding class notice issuance and final approval process.	0.10	795.00	79.50
07/15/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Phone call to Judge Stearns' chambers for clarification of minute order re preliminary approval.	0.10	495.00	49.50
07/15/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Memoranda to and from L. Dardarian and S. Kirkpatrick re: clarification of minute order; class notice schedule.	0.20	495.00	99.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

07/16/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Prepare for class member inquiries re Boston settlement class notice	0.70	225.00	157.50
07/16/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Finalize settlement Notice and draft memo to opposing counsel for final review and approval for use in outreach	0.20	225.00	45.00
07/16/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	1.40	495.00	693.00
07/19/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian and S. Grimes re: class notice and motion for attorneys' fees.	0.40	495.00	198.00
07/19/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with R. Wendell regarding class notice issuance	0.10	795.00	79.50
07/19/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with R. Wendell and S. Grimes regarding class notice and fee petition	0.40	795.00	318.00
07/19/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Exchange emails with G. Chakraborty and T. Murphy re Boston notice project	0.30	225.00	67.50
07/19/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Prepare for class member inquiries re settlement notice	0.20	225.00	45.00
07/19/2021	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ R. Wendell and L. Dardarian re class notice and motion for fees	0.40	255.00	102.00
07/20/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memos to S. Grimes regarding class notice distribution	0.40	795.00	318.00
07/20/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Correspondence with City of Boston re: distributing class notice to organizations.	0.30	495.00	148.50
07/20/2021	Grimes, Scott	Exchange emails w/ L. Dardarian re class notice distribution	0.30	255.00	76.50
07/20/2021	Grimes, Scott	Edit class notice and prepare for distribution	0.50	255.00	127.50
07/20/2021	Grimes, Scott	Draft emails to counsel re contact information for class notice distribution	0.20	255.00	51.00
07/21/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Prepare Boston notice spreadsheet for tracking 7/22/21 notice service	0.30	225.00	67.50
07/21/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Draft notice cover email to recipient organizations	0.40	225.00	90.00
07/21/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Draft letters explaining Boston notice to organizations with no available email address	0.20	225.00	45.00
07/21/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Memos to and from R. Wendell, S. Grimes, and S. Kirkpatrick regarding issuing class notice	0.30	795.00	238.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

07/21/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with S. Kirkpatrick regarding same	0.10	795.00	79.50
07/21/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with S. Grimes regarding same	0.10	795.00	79.50
07/21/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Finalize class notice for distribution.	1.10	495.00	544.50
07/21/2021	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian re class notice	0.10	255.00	25.50
07/21/2021	Grimes, Scott	Revise class notice	0.30	255.00	76.50
07/21/2021	Grimes, Scott	Prepare accessible PDF of class notice for posting and distribution, per settlement	0.40	255.00	102.00
07/21/2021	Grimes, Scott	Draft email to Boston disability organizations re class notice	0.20	255.00	51.00
07/21/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Conference w/ L. Dardarian re class notice issuance	0.10	225.00	22.50
07/22/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Distribute notice to 58 disability rights organizations, and track responses	1.60	225.00	360.00
07/22/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memos to S. Kirkpatrick and S. Grimes regarding notice issuance	0.10	795.00	79.50
07/23/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Track and follow up on additional responses to class notice	0.20	225.00	45.00
07/28/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Conference with L. Dardarian, S. Grimes, and R. Wendell re: preparation for fees motion, service awards, and final approval	1.00	225.00	225.00
07/28/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review class notice posting and plan for fee motion	0.30	795.00	238.50
07/28/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with R. Wendell, S. Grimes, and S. Kirkpatrick regarding fee motion and class notice issuance (Ray for .6)	1.00	795.00	795.00
07/28/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Exchange memos w/ R. Wendell regarding declarations in support of same	0.30	795.00	238.50
07/28/2021	Wendell, Raymond	(Partial) Strategy with L. Dardarian, S. Grimes, and S. Kirkpatrick re: attorneys' fees and service award motions; class notice timeline.	0.60	495.00	297.00
07/28/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft and respond to memoranda to and from L. Dardarian, T. Fox, and T. Murphy re: preparing for motion for attorneys' fees.	2.20	495.00	1,089.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

07/28/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum re: class notice timeline.	0.50	495.00	247.50
07/28/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for attorneys' fees.	2.10	495.00	1,039.50
07/28/2021	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian , S. Kirkpatrick, and R. Wendell (partial) re class notice, motions for fees and service awards	1.00	255.00	255.00
07/29/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Legal research re: Judge Stearns requirements for attorneys' fees motion.	2.00	495.00	990.00
07/30/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Confirm compliance w/ class notice web postings	0.10	225.00	22.50
07/30/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Draft and email follow-up request for notice organizations to confirm receipt of class notice, and track responses in spreadsheet	0.50	225.00	112.50
07/30/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft updates for firm website re: class notice, per preliminary approval order.	0.40	495.00	198.00
07/30/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft declaration of Michael Muehe in Support of Plaintiffs' Motion for Service Awards.	2.20	495.00	1,089.00
07/30/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to S. Kirkpatrick regarding notice issuance	0.20	795.00	159.00
07/30/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with R. Wendell regarding same	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/03/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit Muehe declaration in support of motion for service award	0.20	795.00	159.00
08/03/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft declaration of Elaine Hamilton in support of Motion for Service Awards.	0.60	495.00	297.00
08/03/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft declaration of Crystal Evans in support of Motion for Service Awards.	0.50	495.00	247.50
08/03/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft declaration of Colleen Flanagan in support of Motion for Service Awards.	0.50	495.00	247.50
08/03/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft memorandum to T. Murphy re: Plaintiffs' Motion for Service Awards.	0.60	495.00	297.00
08/06/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	6.20	495.00	3,069.00
08/09/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	3.20	495.00	1,584.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

08/09/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft memorandum to L. Dardarian re: Judge Stearn's orders on attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	2.20	495.00	1,089.00
08/10/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Legal research and draft memo to R. Wendell regarding strategy regarding fee petition	0.70	795.00	556.50
08/10/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	3.20	495.00	1,584.00
08/11/2021	Grimes, Scott	Draft chart of attorneys' fees expenditures for use as exhibit to fee motion	1.90	255.00	484.50
08/11/2021	Grimes, Scott	Exchange emails w/ co-counsel re same	0.10	255.00	25.50
08/11/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with S. Grimes regarding evidence in support of fee petition	0.20	795.00	159.00
08/11/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Research regarding same	0.20	795.00	159.00
08/11/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft correspondence to J. Lederman and A. Cederbaum regarding issuance of class notice	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/11/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to T. Murphy regarding responding to class member inquiries	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/11/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Strategy with R. Wendell regarding fee petition and supporting evidence	0.60	795.00	477.00
08/11/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Correspondence to A. Cederbaum and J. Lederman regarding curb ramp survey results	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/11/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Memos to co-counsel regarding evidence in support of fee petition	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/11/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	1.20	495.00	594.00
08/11/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian re: motions for attorneys' fees, service awards.	0.60	495.00	297.00
08/12/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	6.70	495.00	3,316.50
08/13/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Phone call with L. Dardarian re drafting service award motion and assisting R. Wendell with fee motion.	0.20	465.00	93.00
08/13/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with K. Fisher regarding drafting service award motion and portions of fee motion	0.20	795.00	159.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

08/13/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	6.30	495.00	3,118.50
08/16/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Draft plaintiffs' motion for service awards to class representatives.	1.50	465.00	697.50
08/16/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit fee motion and supporting exhibits	4.40	795.00	3,498.00
08/16/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with K. Fisher regarding same	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/16/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to T. Murphy regarding service award declarations	0.20	795.00	159.00
08/16/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memos to T. Fox and T. Murphy regarding fee petition and evidence in support of same	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/16/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	1.80	495.00	891.00
08/16/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Conference w/ L. Dardarian re same	0.10	465.00	46.50
08/17/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Draft plaintiffs' motion for service awards to class representatives.	0.60	465.00	279.00
08/17/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	6.20	495.00	3,069.00
08/17/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft L. Dardarian declaration in support of fee petition and exhibits thereto	3.30	795.00	2,623.50
08/17/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to T. Fox and T. Murphy re evidence and declarations in support of fee petition	0.30	795.00	238.50
08/18/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	0.80	495.00	396.00
08/18/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft declaration of Linda M. Dardarian in support of Plaintiffs' motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	5.50	495.00	2,722.50
08/18/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference with S. Grimes regarding evidence in support of fee petition	0.30	795.00	238.50
08/18/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memo to T. Murphy regarding same	0.20	795.00	159.00
08/19/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit fee motion, declarations and exhibits thereto	0.80	795.00	636.00
08/19/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft emails to K. Fisher re service award motion	0.10	795.00	79.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

08/19/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft declaration of Linda M. Dardarian in Support of Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorneys' Fees, Costs, and Expenses.	6.50	495.00	3,217.50
08/20/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Draft plaintiffs' motion for service awards to class representatives.	0.50	465.00	232.50
08/20/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Analyze draft class representative declarations.	0.40	465.00	186.00
08/23/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Conference call with L. Dardarian, R. Wendell, K. Fisher, and S. Grimes re: Service Award motion and Fees motion	0.40	225.00	90.00
08/23/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Meet w/ S. Grimes, R. Wendell, K. Fisher, S. Kirkpatrick re attorneys' fee motion, service award motion, declarations and evidence in support of same	0.40	795.00	318.00
08/23/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Strategy w/ R. Wendell re arguments and evidence in support of fee motion	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/23/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memos to T. Fox and T. Murphy re declarations and evidence in support of fee motion	0.20	795.00	159.00
08/23/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft declaration of L. Dardarian in support of fee motion	0.50	795.00	397.50
08/23/2021	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian, R. Wendell, S. Kirkpatrick, K. Fisher and K. Moseley re motions for fees and service awards	0.40	255.00	102.00
08/23/2021	Grimes, Scott	Research re inflation rates for fees motion	0.30	255.00	76.50
08/23/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Conference with L. Dardarian, R. Wendell, S. Grimes, S. Kirkpatrick, and K. Moseley re motions for attorneys fees and service awards.	0.40	465.00	186.00
08/23/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Draft plaintiffs' motion for service awards to class representatives.	2.70	465.00	1,255.50
08/23/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Review and edit draft of Declaration of Elaine Hamilton in Support of Motion for Service Awards.	0.30	495.00	148.50
08/23/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Review and edit draft of Declaration of Michael Muehe in Support of Motion for Service Awards.	0.10	495.00	49.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

08/23/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Review and edit draft of Declaration of Crystal Evans in Support of Motion for Service Awards.	0.10	495.00	49.50
08/23/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Memoranda to and from L. Dardarian and K. Fisher re: Named Plaintiffs' Declarations in Support of Motion for Service Awards.	0.30	495.00	148.50
08/23/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft Declaration of Linda M. Dardarian in Support of Motion for Attorneys' Fees, Costs, and Expenses.	2.30	495.00	1,138.50
08/23/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Leave message for E. Hamilton re declaration in support of motion for service awards.	0.10	465.00	46.50
08/23/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Meet w/ L. Dardarian, S. Grimes, K. Fisher, S. Kirlpatrick re attorneys' fee motion, service award motion, declarations and evidence in support of same	0.40	495.00	198.00
08/24/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Draft plaintiffs' motion for service awards to class representatives.	6.10	465.00	2,836.50
08/24/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Revise declaration of E. Hamilton in support of motion for service awards.	0.80	465.00	372.00
08/24/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Leave message for E. Hamilton re service award declaration.	0.10	465.00	46.50
08/24/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit fee brief	1.40	795.00	1,113.00
08/24/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit declaration of L. Dardarian in support of same	1.10	795.00	874.50
08/24/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit T. Fox declaration and draft memo re same to T. Fox	0.40	795.00	318.00
08/24/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit T. Murphy declaration in support of fee motion and draft memo to T. Murphy re same	0.30	795.00	238.50
08/24/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Draft Declaration of Linda M. Dardarian in Support of Motion for Attorneys' Fees, Costs, and Expenses.	4.50	495.00	2,227.50
08/25/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Draft motion for service awards.	3.50	465.00	1,627.50
08/25/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Begin legal cite-check of Attorneys Fees motion	0.60	225.00	135.00
08/25/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memos to T. Fox and T. Murphy re arguments and evidence in support of fee motion	0.20	795.00	159.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

08/25/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit L. Dardarian declaration in support of fee motion and evidence in support	2.70	795.00	2,146.50
08/25/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit service award motion	0.80	795.00	636.00
08/25/2021	Grimes, Scott	Finalize T. Fox declaration and exchange emails w/ T. Fox re same	1.20	255.00	306.00
08/26/2021	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian, R. Wendell, K. Fisher, S. Kirkpatrick, K. Moseley and M. Miller re motions for fees and service awards	0.50	255.00	127.50
08/26/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Conference with L. Dardarian, R. Wendell, S. Grimes, S. Kirkpatrick, K. Moseley, and M. Miller re fee and service award motions.	0.50	465.00	232.50
08/26/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Phone call with E. Hamilton re finalizing declaration re service awards.	0.10	465.00	46.50
08/26/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Revise motion for service awards re Dardarian declaration and release of claims.	0.30	465.00	139.50
08/26/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Conference with legal team re: service and fee motions	0.50	225.00	112.50
08/26/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Complete legal cite-check and edits to Attorneys' Fees brief	1.60	225.00	360.00
08/26/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Draft proposed order granting plaintiffs' motions for service awards and attorneys fees.	0.30	465.00	139.50
08/26/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Revise E. Hamilton declaration in support of motion for service awards	0.20	465.00	93.00
08/26/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Phone call with E. Hamilton re declaration in support of motion for service awards.	0.60	465.00	279.00
08/26/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Correspondence with K. Moseley, S. Grimes, S. Kirkpatrick, L. Dardarian and R. Wendell re revising and finalizing class representative declarations in support of motion for service awards.	0.20	465.00	93.00
08/26/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Correspondence with L. Dardarian, S. Kirkpatrick, R. Wendell, and S. Grimes re finalizing plaintiff declarations in support of motion for service awards.	0.10	465.00	46.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

08/26/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Correspondence with plaintiffs Muehe, Evans, Flanagan, and Hamilton re finalizing declarations in support of motion for service award, copying S. Grimes and S. Kirkpatrick.	0.20	465.00	93.00
08/26/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ S. Grimes, S. Kirkpatrick, R. Wendell, K. Fisher re fee motion, declarations and evidence in support of and service award motions, plaintiff declarations in support of same	0.50	795.00	397.50
08/26/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Draft memos to K. Fisher and S. Kirkpatrick re same	0.30	795.00	238.50
08/26/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review, edit, and research for L. Dardarian declaration in support of motion for fee award and evidence in support of same	2.50	795.00	1,987.50
08/26/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit fee motion	0.90	795.00	715.50
08/26/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit service award motion	0.10	795.00	79.50
08/26/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit plaintiff declarations for service award motion	0.60	795.00	477.00
08/26/2021	Grimes, Scott	Cite check motion for service awards	2.90	255.00	739.50
08/26/2021	Grimes, Scott	Create accessible PDF of Fox and Murphy declarations	1.80	255.00	459.00
08/26/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian, K. Fisher, S. Grimes, S. Kirkpatrick, M. Miller, and K. Barnes-Moseley re: fee and service award motions.	0.50	495.00	247.50
08/26/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Phone call with M. Muehe re: declaration in support of motion for service awards.	0.40	495.00	198.00
08/26/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Declaration of Michael Muehe in Support of Motion for Service Awards.	0.30	495.00	148.50
08/26/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Phone call with C. Evans re: declaration in support of motion for service awards.	0.30	495.00	148.50
08/26/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Declaration of C. Evans in Support of Motion for Service Awards.	0.20	495.00	99.00
08/26/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Declaration of Linda M. Dardarian in Support of Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorneys' Fees, Costs, and Expenses.	1.00	495.00	495.00

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

08/26/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Research hourly rates approved by courts in Massachusetts.	4.60	495.00	2,277.00
08/27/2021	Grimes, Scott	Conference w/ L. Dardarian, R. Wendell, K. Fisher and S. Kirkpatrick re motions for fees and service awards	0.40	255.00	102.00
08/27/2021	Kirkpatrick, Stuart	Conference with legal team re: finalizing service award and attorneys fees motions and supporting documents	0.40	225.00	90.00
08/27/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Conference with L. Dardarian, R. Wendell, S. Grimes, S. Kirkpatrick, K. Moseley, and M. Miller re motions for fees and costs and service awards, declarations in support thereof, and proposed order.	0.40	465.00	186.00
08/27/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Strategy with L. Dardarian, K. Fisher, S. Grimes, S. Kirkpatrick, M. Miller, and K. Barnes-Moseley re: fee and service award motions.	0.40	495.00	198.00
08/27/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit Declaration of Linda M. Dardarian in Support of Plaintiffs' Motion for Attorneys' Fees, Costs, and Expenses.	1.40	495.00	693.00
08/27/2021	Wendell, Raymond	Edit memorandum of points and authorities in support of motion for attorneys' fees, costs, and expenses.	1.70	495.00	841.50
08/27/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Phone call with plaintiff E. Hamilton re finalizing declaration in support of motion for service award.	0.10	465.00	46.50
08/27/2021	Fisher, Katharine	Revise motion for class representative service awards.	0.20	465.00	93.00
08/27/2021	Grimes, Scott	Fact check motion for service awards	1.20	255.00	306.00
08/27/2021	Grimes, Scott	Fact check motion for fees	2.30	255.00	586.50
08/27/2021	Grimes, Scott	Prepare exhibits for L. Dardarian declaration	1.40	255.00	357.00
08/27/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Conference w/ R. Wendell, K. Fisher, S. Grimes and S. Kirkpatrick re finalizing attorneys' fee motion and service award motion and supporting declarations and exhibits thereto	0.40	795.00	318.00
08/27/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit proposed order	0.10	795.00	79.50

GBDH Billing Detail

City of Boston

fees and matter id = '649' and not hidden and not hidden and not on hold and date <=8/27/2021

08/27/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit L. Dardarian declaration for fee motion	1.60	795.00	1,272.00
08/27/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Review and edit fee motion	1.10	795.00	874.50
08/27/2021	Dardarian, Linda	Research and review evidence and strategize arguments for fee motion	1.30	795.00	1,033.50
		Grand Total:		<u>998.7000</u>	<u>448528.50</u>