

EXHIBIT A

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
18593	Hours Worked	3/9/2017	0.2	Stan Eichner	Send accessibility study to team w/ cover email
35002	Hours Worked	7/27/2017	0.9	Stan Eichner	Conference call with counsel; review of the data received and analyzed; dividing up tasks
35003	Hours Worked	7/27/2017	0.1	Stan Eichner	Follow up conversation w/ TM re task assigned and offer of help
53802	Hours Worked	2/1/2018	0.6	Stan Eichner	Conference call with Tim F., Linda D., TM and RG
57977	Hours Worked	3/15/2018	0.4	Stan Eichner	Conference call w/ co-counsel, TF, and TM and follow up email
60317	Hours Worked	4/4/2018	0.2	Stan Eichner	Emails about photo taking on Monday
60610	Hours Worked	4/9/2018	2	Stan Eichner	Traveling to So. Boston and finance district and take pictures of non-conforming curb ramps and intersections
61028	Hours Worked	4/12/2018	0.4	Stan Eichner	Telephone calls with Plaintiff Colleen F. and TM
63625	Hours Worked	5/7/2018	0.5	Stan Eichner	Communication and call w/ co-counsel - TF
70125	Hours Worked	7/9/2018	0.4	Stan Eichner	Telephone call with co-counsel
70126	Hours Worked	7/9/2018	0.6	Stan Eichner	Initial telephone call with the City
77741	Hours Worked	10/1/2018	0.3	Stan Eichner	Emails about agenda and meeting with Boston
78537	Hours Worked	10/10/2018	0.3	Stan Eichner	Reading and responding to emails from Boston and co-counsel: TF, LD and TM, several each
78669	Hours Worked	10/11/2018	0.3	Stan Eichner	Series of emails about upcoming meeting and conference call with Boston and co-counsel
79480	Hours Worked	10/18/2018	0.6	Stan Eichner	Conference call with City of Boston [LD, TF, TM & me)
80392	Hours Worked	10/29/2018	1.6	Stan Eichner	Conference call with co-counsel and clients re this week's meeting; series of emails re scheduling and other preparation issues
81320	Hours Worked	11/8/2018	1.8	Stan Eichner	Reviewing materials for afternoon conference call and related emails in preparation
81409	Hours Worked	11/8/2018	0.6	Stan Eichner	Further preparation for call and the call itself
83686	Hours Worked	12/6/2018	0.6	Stan Eichner	Reviewing materials to prepare for meeting and conferring with TM
83752	Hours Worked	12/6/2018	3.8	Stan Eichner	Meeting with representatives from City of Boston 10-30 - 2; and meeting with MM afterwards .3

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
87347	Hours Worked	1/22/2019	0.4	Stan Eichner	Emails to and from Tom and Tim and follow up
90539	Hours Worked	2/27/2019	2.2	Stan Eichner	Review of packet of materials received from Boston in preparation for internal advocacy team meeting and meeting with the City
90964	Hours Worked	3/4/2019	0.7	Stan Eichner	Conference call with co-counsel to prepare for meeting on Tuesday
91082	Hours Worked	3/5/2019	2.4	Stan Eichner	Prepare for meeting with Boston and attending meeting at City Hall
93834	Hours Worked	4/1/2019	0.3	Stan Eichner	Emails to and from Tom and rest of team about Tuesday meetings
93868	Hours Worked	4/1/2019	1.4	Stan Eichner	Review emails about Boston's response and our strategy with client, MM, w/ LD and TF, and related emails to MS re effect on scheduling, etc.
94114	Hours Worked	4/2/2019	3.1	Stan Eichner	Meeting w/ Linda D. re case; conference call w/ co-counsel before meeting with Boston, meeting with City of Boston staff, conferring with LD afterwards
	SE total		26.7		
17808	Hours Worked	3/3/2017	0.4	Tom Murphy	Emails with DLC Executive Director re case, assignments for law students; research and list of projects
18029	Hours Worked	3/6/2017	0.4	Tom Murphy	Legal research: Taunton case; related emails
18435	Hours Worked	3/8/2017	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review photos of non-compliant ramps, intersections
18573	Hours Worked	3/9/2017	2	Tom Murphy	ADAAG, UFAS research; review intern's research; prepare attend and team conference call; notes
18605	Hours Worked	3/9/2017	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review Boston pedestrian ramp study; related emails
18966	Hours Worked	3/13/2017	1	Tom Murphy	Legal research - Statute of Limitations
21537	Hours Worked	3/31/2017	0.4	Tom Murphy	Legal research - USDC MA Title III case, Marradi - standing, readily achievable elements
22090	Hours Worked	4/3/2017	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review letter from City; related emails with team
28719	Hours Worked	5/31/2017	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review Beacon Hill sidewalk lawsuit article; related emails with team re case impact
33889	Hours Worked	7/18/2017	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review Seattle settlement agreement
34285	Hours Worked	7/21/2017	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with TF re data

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
34952	Hours Worked	7/26/2017	1.4	Tom Murphy	Review documents and other data in preparation for team conference call
35001	Hours Worked	7/27/2017	0.9	Tom Murphy	Legal team conference call - preliminary review of data, distribution of tasks
35038	Hours Worked	7/27/2017	0.2	Tom Murphy	Follow up emails re data and next conference call
35353	Hours Worked	7/31/2017	1	Tom Murphy	Initial review of complaints to City; categorize
35424	Hours Worked	7/31/2017	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review documents and data; prepare for team conference call
35426	Hours Worked	7/31/2017	0.8	Tom Murphy	Conference call with TF, Scott; Katie re database and plan for coding of violations
35895	Hours Worked	8/3/2017	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review CREEC memo re coding project
36006	Hours Worked	8/3/2017	2	Tom Murphy	Mapping and coding intersections and violations
36660	Hours Worked	8/9/2017	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with Tim and Scott re coding project
37678	Hours Worked	8/17/2017	0.5	Tom Murphy	Review mapping data
40731	Hours Worked	9/19/2017	0.4	Tom Murphy	Emails with TF and Scott re data
45709	Hours Worked	11/6/2017	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails and review accessibility survey
49172	Hours Worked	12/14/2017	1	Tom Murphy	Review coding data
53575	Hours Worked	1/31/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review documents; prepare for team conference call
53711	Hours Worked	2/1/2018	0.8	Tom Murphy	Conference call re update and strategy; research; email to team and follow-up emails
53975	Hours Worked	2/2/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Research and review Boston budget documents
55106	Hours Worked	2/13/2018	0.5	Tom Murphy	Review data sent by TF
55270	Hours Worked	2/14/2018	0.5	Tom Murphy	Review law student legal memo; review Boston workplans; email re same
55399	Hours Worked	2/15/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with SE re case status, workplan
55426	Hours Worked	2/16/2018	0.6	Tom Murphy	Emails with TF re photos of violations, client retainer; emails w/ RG re photos; review data
56470	Hours Worked	2/28/2018	0.5	Tom Murphy	Review/comment draft Demand letter
56711	Hours Worked	3/2/2018	1.2	Tom Murphy	Legal research; Boston public documents research; edits to draft Demand letter
56855	Hours Worked	3/5/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Emails and telephone calls re plaintiffs
56955	Hours Worked	3/5/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with TF re draft Demand letter
57075	Hours Worked	3/6/2018	0.7	Tom Murphy	Review latest draft Demand letter; comments, emails with team re same; MA AAB research
57122	Hours Worked	3/7/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Draft DLC description section

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
57547	Hours Worked	3/9/2018	0.5	Tom Murphy	Follow-up with potential Plaintiffs; review latest draft of demand letter
57883	Hours Worked	3/14/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Finalize DLC description section for demand letter
57985	Hours Worked	3/15/2018	0.6	Tom Murphy	Review Demand letter; telephone call with Tim F. and SE re same; review Seattle demand letter
58075	Hours Worked	3/15/2018	1.1	Tom Murphy	Plaintiffs: telephone call with Elaine H; telephone call with Michael M.; google maps research
58417	Hours Worked	3/19/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Team emails re status; review documents, demand letter
58634	Hours Worked	3/21/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Team emails; review Google Maps
58823	Hours Worked	3/23/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with Elaine H. re her experiences
58917	Hours Worked	3/23/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with TF re ramp photos, workplan; review documents
58969	Hours Worked	3/23/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Michael M. description of experiences and emails
59122	Hours Worked	3/26/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Plaintiffs - emails with M.M.; emails with Bill H.; telephone call SE re status
59838	Hours Worked	3/30/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails, drafting re plaintiffs statements
60475	Hours Worked	4/5/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails to plaintiffs re updates, status
60877	Hours Worked	4/11/2018	1	Tom Murphy	Plaintiffs: emails with C. Evans, M. Muehe; telephone call with Crystal Evans; telephone call with Elaine Hamilton; finalize Elaine H. vignette
61043	Hours Worked	4/12/2018	0.6	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with SE re status; telephone call with Colleen F.; draft claimant vignettes
61161	Hours Worked	4/13/2018	0.7	Tom Murphy	Emails with Michael, Crystal, Colleen re status of vignettes; edit vignettes; team emails re same
62413	Hours Worked	4/26/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Complete claimant vignettes; email TF and SE
62624	Hours Worked	4/27/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with TF re plaintiffs, retainers
63285	Hours Worked	5/3/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Phone call with TF re final plaintiff statements; review final draft demand letter
63547	Hours Worked	5/7/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Phone call with TF re demand letter
63567	Hours Worked	5/7/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review, file final demand letter which was sent today with exhibits
63839	Hours Worked	5/7/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with clients re retainer agreements
64315	Hours Worked	5/11/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Emails with claimants re retainer and demand letter

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
64522	Hours Worked	5/15/2018	1.4	Tom Murphy	Attend Project Sidewalk webinar; related research
64699	Hours Worked	5/16/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with Elaine Hamilton re status
65406	Hours Worked	5/23/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re Boston response to demand letter
65426	Hours Worked	5/23/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review CP email and materials from Boston forum
66988	Hours Worked	6/6/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with Elaine Hamilton re sidewalks, experiences
68714	Hours Worked	6/21/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review correspondence from Boston
70135	Hours Worked	7/9/2018	0.5	Tom Murphy	Prepare and telephone call with co-counsel to discuss call with City attorney
70136	Hours Worked	7/9/2018	0.6	Tom Murphy	Conference call with co-counsel and City attorney
70241	Hours Worked	7/10/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with Colleen F. re retainer; email Michael M. re same
70557	Hours Worked	7/12/2018	0.1	Tom Murphy	Follow up email to Michael re status
70757	Hours Worked	7/16/2018	0.8	Tom Murphy	Review documents from the City; emails with team re same
70981	Hours Worked	7/18/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with Michael re status
74136	Hours Worked	8/20/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review prior correspondence and emails; emails with team re follow up to City
74595	Hours Worked	8/22/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Email team with Plaintiff updates
75861	Hours Worked	9/7/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with Colleen F re retainer, update
76040	Hours Worked	9/11/2018	0.5	Tom Murphy	Research Seattle, LA, Denver settlements
77049	Hours Worked	9/24/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review Boston emails and team emails
77730	Hours Worked	10/1/2018	0.5	Tom Murphy	Team emails re scheduling; review draft agenda; calls to clients re status, meeting
78047	Hours Worked	10/3/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with clients re meeting with City
78886	Hours Worked	10/12/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Team emails re meeting with Boston; emails to clients re same
79001	Hours Worked	10/15/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with clients re meeting, conference call
79064	Hours Worked	10/16/2018	1	Tom Murphy	Research re Age Friendly Boston
79482	Hours Worked	10/18/2018	1	Tom Murphy	Review documents; prepare; conference call with City and team (TF, LD, SE); follow up team -mails and email to clients
79625	Hours Worked	10/19/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review/comment draft email to City attorneys
80141	Hours Worked	10/24/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Emails with clients re preparation for telephone call and meeting with City
80423	Hours Worked	10/29/2018	1	Tom Murphy	Conference call with co-counsel and clients to prepare for 10/31 meeting with City

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
80424	Hours Worked	10/29/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with City attorney re meeting location; team emails and telephone call with TF re rescheduling; emails with clients
80608	Hours Worked	10/30/2018	0.5	Tom Murphy	Phone call with clients re rescheduling; review documents from City
80618	Hours Worked	10/31/2018	0.7	Tom Murphy	Conference call with City attorneys
81357	Hours Worked	11/8/2018	1	Tom Murphy	Review documents from the City in preparation for conference call with City attorneys; emails with team in preparation for conference call
81358	Hours Worked	11/8/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with clients re 12/6 meeting
81410	Hours Worked	11/8/2018	0.4	Tom Murphy	Conference call preparation and conference call with City attorneys
81508	Hours Worked	11/9/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with Elaine H. re status
81816	Hours Worked	11/14/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with Elaine H. re status
82617	Hours Worked	11/26/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review listserv information re D.C. snow removal plans
83207	Hours Worked	11/30/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review documents from the City
83492	Hours Worked	12/4/2018	0.8	Tom Murphy	Review documents and prepare for call; conference call with TF and LD; email SE and clients re update
83599	Hours Worked	12/5/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Reminder email to clients with demand letter
83627	Hours Worked	12/5/2018	2	Tom Murphy	Review documents and prepare for meeting with City
83654	Hours Worked	12/5/2018	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review annotated meeting agenda
83782	Hours Worked	12/6/2018	3.5	Tom Murphy	Meeting with City; negotiations
83783	Hours Worked	12/6/2018	4.7	Tom Murphy	Travel to/from Boston; and to/from City Hall
83871	Hours Worked	12/7/2018	1	Tom Murphy	Review notes from meeting; draft follow up questions; emails with team; ADA guideline and Access Board guideline research
83919	Hours Worked	12/10/2018	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with team re follow up questions; edit and send questions to City attorneys
86164	Hours Worked	1/8/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Team emails and email to Boston re information and meeting
86309	Hours Worked	1/9/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re exchange of information with City
86870	Hours Worked	1/16/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review Walsh state of city address for information re PROW, infrastructure, etc.
87305	Hours Worked	1/22/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with clients re rescheduled meeting

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
90899	Hours Worked	3/4/2019	1.3	Tom Murphy	Review email and documents from City in response to our questions; prepare for and participate in conference call with legal team (SE, TF, LD)
91077	Hours Worked	3/5/2019	2.8	Tom Murphy	Meeting with City - travel and preparation time
91078	Hours Worked	3/5/2019	2.2	Tom Murphy	Meeting with City attorneys and department representatives
91249	Hours Worked	3/7/2019	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review notes from meeting and draft follow up questions/requests; circulate to team
91397	Hours Worked	3/8/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Finalize, send list of follow up questions
91454	Hours Worked	3/8/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with DLC Executive Director re status
92389	Hours Worked	3/18/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with clients re meeting; telephone call with Michael M. re status
92853	Hours Worked	3/22/2019	0.4	Tom Murphy	Phone call w/ Michael M. re last meeting, our follow up questions; follow up emails
93347	Hours Worked	3/27/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with team; emails with City re questions
93791	Hours Worked	4/1/2019	0.6	Tom Murphy	Email to City re questions/documents; emails with team re strategy; telephone call with Jason L.; additional emails with team, Michael M.
94012	Hours Worked	4/2/2019	0.7	Tom Murphy	Review documents from the City, prepare for conference call with SE, LD and TF re strategy for meeting
94067	Hours Worked	4/2/2019	1.6	Tom Murphy	Meeting with City (phone - me and TF; in person - SE, LD, Michael M.)
95664	Hours Worked	4/23/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with LD and TF re status, strategy
95938	Hours Worked	4/24/2019	1	Tom Murphy	Review/edit draft term sheet; emails with team re same
96021	Hours Worked	4/25/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Email opposing counsel re our outstanding requests
96303	Hours Worked	4/30/2019	0.6	Tom Murphy	Review final term sheet; emails with team and clients re same; review email from opposing counsel re responses to questions
96513	Hours Worked	5/1/2019	1.2	Tom Murphy	Review email from opposing counsel and answers to questions; review PWD Construction Progress Report
96796	Hours Worked	5/2/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with team re strategy
96999	Hours Worked	5/7/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Research and emails with team re Beacon Hill issues

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
97256	Hours Worked	5/8/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with team re Monday conference call, confirming, strategy call
97312	Hours Worked	5/9/2019	1	Tom Murphy	Emails with opposing counsel re conference call planning; review data and DPW documents from the City
97547	Hours Worked	5/13/2019	1.7	Tom Murphy	Prepare for conference call with team; conference call with City re draft term sheet; follow up emails with team and with City to schedule next meeting
97649	Hours Worked	5/14/2019	0.4	Tom Murphy	Emails with clients re update on negotiations, questions, etc.
99476	Hours Worked	5/31/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re meeting with City
99626	Hours Worked	6/3/2019	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review City's response to draft term sheet; team emails re same
99842	Hours Worked	6/6/2019	0.6	Tom Murphy	Review documents and emails with team; planning call re today's meeting with the City
99843	Hours Worked	6/6/2019	0.7	Tom Murphy	Conference call with City to negotiate Term Sheet
99850	Hours Worked	6/6/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Update emails to plaintiffs, TP
100026	Hours Worked	6/7/2019	0.5	Tom Murphy	Review email from Jason L. re survey; emails with team re same
100122	Hours Worked	6/10/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with Michael M. re status
100433	Hours Worked	6/13/2019	0.4	Tom Murphy	Emails with team re City's survey plan and tasks prior to next meeting; emails with Plaintiffs re update
101304	Hours Worked	6/21/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with City re next week's meeting
101380	Hours Worked	6/24/2019	0.5	Tom Murphy	Team emails re meeting; review documents; emails with clients
101782	Hours Worked	6/27/2019	2.2	Tom Murphy	Review documents and prepare; conference call with the City re survey; follow up team emails; email M.M. re capital funds; research re c. 90 funds
102481	Hours Worked	7/3/2019	0.4	Tom Murphy	Emails with Michael M. re revenue sources; research; email team re same
102539	Hours Worked	7/5/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Research re potential City revenue sources
102647	Hours Worked	7/8/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails re next meeting with City
102834	Hours Worked	7/10/2019	1.3	Tom Murphy	Review documents; prepare; and conference call with the City; review and edit follow-up email to opposing counsel; emails with clients
103527	Hours Worked	7/17/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Legal research - Hamer 10th Cir. case
104661	Hours Worked	7/29/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Team emails - negotiation call preparation

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
104670	Hours Worked	7/29/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Negotiation conference call with City
104710	Hours Worked	7/29/2019	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review draft request for production; emails with team re same
104846	Hours Worked	7/30/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Transportation bond research
105473	Hours Worked	8/2/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with team and review/edit draft request for production of documents
106022	Hours Worked	8/12/2019	0.5	Tom Murphy	Review/edit draft consent decree; email DLC Lit. Dir. re same; team emails re same
106568	Hours Worked	8/16/2019	0.8	Tom Murphy	Review prior survey materials and public record request documents; meeting preparation
106874	Hours Worked	8/21/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Planning emails re tomorrow's negotiation meeting
107009	Hours Worked	8/22/2019	1	Tom Murphy	Review documents, prepare; conference call with the City (Adam and Jason)
107032	Hours Worked	8/22/2019	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review agreements in prior cases and emails with team re which to send to Boston
107597	Hours Worked	8/28/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with team and City re previous settlements
108079	Hours Worked	9/4/2019	0.4	Tom Murphy	Research - review New York settlement documents; emails with team re same
108328	Hours Worked	9/6/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with clients, CE, EH re status
109290	Hours Worked	9/18/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re prompting Boston responses to draft Consent Decree
109919	Hours Worked	9/27/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails in preparation for next week's meeting
110327	Hours Worked	10/1/2019	1	Tom Murphy	Prepare and conference call with City; negotiations
110981	Hours Worked	10/8/2019	0.5	Tom Murphy	Team conference call re debrief from last call with City, prepare for next call
111366	Hours Worked	10/15/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Email from city re commitment on ramp numbers; team emails re same
111657	Hours Worked	10/17/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team conference call to prepare for today's call with City
111665	Hours Worked	10/17/2019	0.8	Tom Murphy	Conference call with City - negotiations re draft Consent Decree and annual commitment
113699	Hours Worked	11/12/2019	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re status; client emails re same
113798	Hours Worked	11/13/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review documents and prepare for meeting with the City; Stantec research
113832	Hours Worked	11/13/2019	0.5	Tom Murphy	Negotiations - conference call with Jason and Adam

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
114346	Hours Worked	11/19/2019	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review Stantec proposal
114375	Hours Worked	11/19/2019	0.5	Tom Murphy	Team conference call to discuss Stantec proposal and outline response; review draft response
114412	Hours Worked	11/20/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review documents and prepare for call with City
114418	Hours Worked	11/20/2019	0.7	Tom Murphy	Negotiations telephone call with City
114571	Hours Worked	11/22/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails re follow up issues with City and Stantec
115241	Hours Worked	12/3/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Team emails re meeting today; review documents and prepare for meeting
115261	Hours Worked	12/3/2019	0.4	Tom Murphy	Negotiations - conference call with City
115270	Hours Worked	12/4/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with clients re status of negotiations
115676	Hours Worked	12/9/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with clients; emails with team re conference call preparation
115886	Hours Worked	12/10/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review documents and prepare for meeting
115890	Hours Worked	12/10/2019	0.6	Tom Murphy	Conference call with City
115892	Hours Worked	12/10/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with co-counsel re fees; internal emails re DLC time and spreadsheet
116144	Hours Worked	12/11/2019	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review DPW responses to our questions re Stantec contract/mandates
116182	Hours Worked	12/12/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review/edit fees spreadsheet for negotiations with City
116768	Hours Worked	12/18/2019	0.3	Tom Murphy	Conference call with City; negotiations
117823	Hours Worked	1/5/2020	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with team re previous negotiations call with City and plan for next call
118466	Hours Worked	1/10/2020	0.7	Tom Murphy	Conference call with team to prepare for today's call with the City to negotiate terms of proposed Consent Decree
118482	Hours Worked	1/10/2020	1.2	Tom Murphy	Prepare and conference call with City re proposed Consent Decree
118513	Hours Worked	1/10/2020	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review follow up data sent by City
119425	Hours Worked	1/21/2020	0.6	Tom Murphy	Review our edits to Consent Decree and emails with team re same; review additional documents to be sent to City and prepare for conference call
119651	Hours Worked	1/23/2020	1.2	Tom Murphy	Review documents and prepare; and Negotiations conference call with the City
121450	Hours Worked	2/10/2020	0.4	Tom Murphy	Prepare for team strategy call; team emails re postponement

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
121777	Hours Worked	2/13/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails re receiving documents from the City
122303	Hours Worked	2/20/2020	0.5	Tom Murphy	Team emails re next steps, client service awards; client emails re setting up phone meetings
122591	Hours Worked	2/24/2020	1	Tom Murphy	Emails and telephone calls with clients re negotiations status and service awards
122886	Hours Worked	2/26/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with team re Plaintiffs input
123478	Hours Worked	3/3/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re status and LD conversation with Adam
123663	Hours Worked	3/5/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Provide update for DLC Lit. Dir.
123984	Hours Worked	3/10/2020	0.6	Tom Murphy	Review City's latest draft/edits to Consent Decree, team emails re same and meeting
124410	Hours Worked	3/16/2020	0.3	Tom Murphy	Prepare for team conference call
124411	Hours Worked	3/16/2020	0.9	Tom Murphy	Team conference call re City's latest draft Consent Decree, strategy
124878	Hours Worked	3/18/2020	0.6	Tom Murphy	Review transition plan and other documents from City
127592	Hours Worked	4/8/2020	0.5	Tom Murphy	Boston budget research
129859	Hours Worked	4/29/2020	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review/comment latest edits to draft Consent Decree; emails with team re strategy
130749	Hours Worked	5/4/2020	0.3	Tom Murphy	Team emails and email with opposing counsel
131080	Hours Worked	5/6/2020	0.3	Tom Murphy	Research re Boston latest construction order and guidance; emails with team re same
131532	Hours Worked	5/12/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with City re meeting
132514	Hours Worked	5/19/2020	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with team; telephone call to City attorneys
133515	Hours Worked	5/29/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Telephone call to Adam C. and email to team
134061	Hours Worked	6/2/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re next steps
134224	Hours Worked	6/4/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with City and team re next steps
134779	Hours Worked	6/9/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with Michael M. re status of negotiations
136083	Hours Worked	6/19/2020	1	Tom Murphy	Prepare and telephone call with City re status; emails w DLC Lit. Dir.
136156	Hours Worked	6/19/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review contract documents from City
136682	Hours Worked	6/24/2020	0.4	Tom Murphy	Boston FY 21 budget research; email team re same
136784	Hours Worked	6/25/2020	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review survey documents from City and prepare for meeting

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
136822	Hours Worked	6/25/2020	1.6	Tom Murphy	Conference call with City re terms of Consent Decree; follow up emails with team re same
137630	Hours Worked	7/1/2020	0.4	Tom Murphy	Conference call with team re debrief from last call with City, edits to Consent Decree based on that call
138952	Hours Worked	7/14/2020	1.5	Tom Murphy	Conference call with City re terms of Consent Decree (1.1) and follow up call with team (.4)
139626	Hours Worked	7/20/2020	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with Michael M. re puddles/snow issue
139766	Hours Worked	7/21/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Email from Michael M. and emails with co-counsel re puddle issue
140068	Hours Worked	7/22/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review City's edits to draft Consent Decree
140133	Hours Worked	7/23/2020	1.4	Tom Murphy	Negotiation conference call with City
141850	Hours Worked	8/5/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review/comment Linda D. edits to draft Consent Decree
143490	Hours Worked	8/17/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review City's response to latest draft
143766	Hours Worked	8/19/2020	0.7	Tom Murphy	Negotiations and status update DB notes, follow up emails; review documents from the City
147245	Hours Worked	9/17/2020	1.2	Tom Murphy	Prepare; negotiations with City; follow up emails with team
148129	Hours Worked	9/24/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review email from Jason re private developers
148372	Hours Worked	9/25/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re including discussion of adding 2025 meet and confer to Consent Decree due to changed circumstances brought on by COVID
148443	Hours Worked	9/28/2020	0.6	Tom Murphy	Review email from Jason; conference call with City/negotiations
148726	Hours Worked	9/30/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with team re revisions to Consent Decree
150758	Hours Worked	10/15/2020	0.6	Tom Murphy	Review City's revisions; call with City; follow-up team emails
151957	Hours Worked	10/23/2020	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review proposed edits to Consent Decree; emails with team re same
152063	Hours Worked	10/26/2020	0.5	Tom Murphy	Preparation and negotiations call with City
153535	Hours Worked	11/4/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re next steps
153713	Hours Worked	11/5/2020	0.5	Tom Murphy	Negotiations call with City; email to clients with update

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
154205	Hours Worked	11/10/2020	0.6	Tom Murphy	Research re damages standard in 1st Cir.; emails with team re same; emails with clients
155053	Hours Worked	11/17/2020	0.5	Tom Murphy	Conference call with opposing counsel - negotiations/conversation re damages and fees
155060	Hours Worked	11/17/2020	0.4	Tom Murphy	Fees: retainer agreements review; hours calculations; email TP; co-counsel telephone call re same
156552	Hours Worked	12/1/2020	0.5	Tom Murphy	Negotiation call with City re damages, service awards; initial discussion of fees
157003	Hours Worked	12/3/2020	1	Tom Murphy	Timesheets review, categorize, prepare for fee demand
157070	Hours Worked	12/4/2020	0.5	Tom Murphy	Emails with team re fees
157280	Hours Worked	12/4/2020	0.4	Tom Murphy	Emails with Plaintiffs - update, damages
157304	Hours Worked	12/7/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with Elaine Hamilton - update, damages
157892	Hours Worked	12/10/2020	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review draft complaint
158486	Hours Worked	12/15/2020	0.3	Tom Murphy	Team emails re fee demand contents
158780	Hours Worked	12/17/2020	0.2	Tom Murphy	Edits to fee demand letter
159504	Hours Worked	12/22/2020	0.4	Tom Murphy	Communications with clients re damages, Consent Decree status
161171	Hours Worked	1/8/2021	1	Tom Murphy	Conference call with City re attorneys' fees; follow-up emails with co-counsel re same and review records
161449	Hours Worked	1/12/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with co-counsel re demand
161805	Hours Worked	1/13/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with DLC Lit. Dir. re case update
162499	Hours Worked	1/19/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review/edit follow-up fees letter
164323	Hours Worked	2/1/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with City
164771	Hours Worked	2/2/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails re fees and revised agreement section re fees
167338	Hours Worked	2/22/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Globe article re new admin appointments; team emails re same and emails re meeting
167581	Hours Worked	2/23/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with team re next steps and proposed fee language
169128	Hours Worked	3/3/2021	1	Tom Murphy	Negotiations call with City; emails with DLC Lit. Dir. re update, most recent version of Consent Decree
169847	Hours Worked	3/8/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with co-counsel re updating complaint
169939	Hours Worked	3/9/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Emails with Michael M. re variances; review draft Consent Decree and discuss same with MM

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
171205	Hours Worked	3/16/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Email clients re Complaint updates
171407	Hours Worked	3/17/2021	0.6	Tom Murphy	Prepare and negotiations call with City
171522	Hours Worked	3/17/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Edits to draft complaint
171879	Hours Worked	3/19/2021	0.5	Tom Murphy	Conference call with co-counsel re counter proposal on monitoring fees
171923	Hours Worked	3/19/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Follow up emails to clients re status
172439	Hours Worked	3/24/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re monitoring fees
172643	Hours Worked	3/25/2021	0.1	Tom Murphy	Correspondence to City re monitoring
172974	Hours Worked	3/26/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with clients re complaint updates
173087	Hours Worked	3/29/2021	0.8	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with City, negotiations
173094	Hours Worked	3/29/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Follow-up team emails and re-scheduling emails
173255	Hours Worked	3/30/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review/comment edits to Consent Decree re dispute resolution, fees; team emails re same
173495	Hours Worked	3/31/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Team conference call to discuss proposed changes to dispute resolution section
173632	Hours Worked	4/1/2021	0.1	Tom Murphy	Communication to opposing counsel re dispute resolution
173636	Hours Worked	4/1/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Edits to Plaintiff experiences section of complaint; emails to clients re same
174578	Hours Worked	4/8/2021	0.6	Tom Murphy	Negotiations call with City
174579	Hours Worked	4/8/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Team conference call to discuss monitoring fees, other issues from negotiations call
174684	Hours Worked	4/9/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review/edit draft email to City in response to issues raised in yesterday's negotiations
175014	Hours Worked	4/13/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review email from Adam and their redlines to draft Consent Decree; emails with team and conference call to prepare for call with City today
175121	Hours Worked	4/13/2021	0.8	Tom Murphy	Negotiations call with City
175247	Hours Worked	4/14/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Email Crystal and Colleen re edits; incorporate Crystal edits into draft Complaint; review latest edits to draft Consent Decree and team email re same and re Notice
175325	Hours Worked	4/14/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review Boston FY '22 budget; emails with team re relevant portions
176533	Hours Worked	4/26/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review/comment Motion for Preliminary Approval
176770	Hours Worked	4/27/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Review final draft of Consent Decree; emails re meeting; review draft Class Notice

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
176937	Hours Worked	4/28/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Work on notice publication list; team emails re same
177187	Hours Worked	4/29/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Team emails re remaining tasks, schedule; review Notice lists from prior cases and work on Boston Notice list
177383	Hours Worked	5/3/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re communication with City regarding list of violations; emails with Bill H. re advocacy organizations for Notice
177480	Hours Worked	5/3/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re today's call with City
177778	Hours Worked	5/4/2021	0.7	Tom Murphy	Team conference call re next steps, delineation of tasks; review final draft Consent Decree; email E. Hamilton re complaint update
177868	Hours Worked	5/5/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Update DB: Current status and schedule re pleadings
178204	Hours Worked	5/7/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails with Bill H re advocacy organizations for Notice
178943	Hours Worked	5/13/2021	1.3	Tom Murphy	Finalize list of Notice recipients; review drafts of Proposed Order and Final Judgment
179520	Hours Worked	5/18/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with City re final Consent Decree, Notice, next steps
179641	Hours Worked	5/18/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review/edit Preliminary Approval Motion; attorneys' fees research
179766	Hours Worked	5/19/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re Preliminary Approval motion
180313	Hours Worked	5/25/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Conference call with Boston re status of pleadings, next steps; follow up team emails re filing tasks
180424	Hours Worked	5/26/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Team emails re pleadings, filing; review USDC requirements; create sample PHV motion
180555	Hours Worked	5/26/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review City's edits to pleadings; team emails re same
181142	Hours Worked	6/1/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails re Class Notice recipients
181451	Hours Worked	6/2/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Emails with clients re declarations
181574	Hours Worked	6/3/2021	0.8	Tom Murphy	Emails and telephone call with Elaine H.; review and edit Declaration by phone with Elaine H
181785	Hours Worked	6/7/2021	0.7	Tom Murphy	Revise plaintiff declarations; emails with team re same and filing timeframe; telephone call with Coleen F.

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
182389	Hours Worked	6/10/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Review curb ramp request forms from Portland and Seattle; team emails re same
182468	Hours Worked	6/11/2021	0.5	Tom Murphy	Conference call with City re current status, next steps
182475	Hours Worked	6/11/2021	0.5	Tom Murphy	Follow up emails w Colleen F. re declaration; emails with team re filing logistics, attorney declarations
182650	Hours Worked	6/14/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	finalize Colleen F. And Michael M. Declarations
182809	Hours Worked	6/15/2021	0.8	Tom Murphy	Team emails; review local rules; prepare for filing; complete local forms; review final Consent Decree
183224	Hours Worked	6/17/2021	0.5	Tom Murphy	Conference call with City re status of final approval of Consent Decree and pleadings
183226	Hours Worked	6/17/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Conference call and emails with co-counsel re status, filing, press release, client communications
183233	Hours Worked	6/17/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Telephone calls to clients re signatures, press
183665	Hours Worked	6/17/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Communications with clients; work on press release
184653	Hours Worked	6/30/2021	1.2	Tom Murphy	Prepare pleadings; ECF filing of Complaint and Pro Hac motions
184687	Hours Worked	6/30/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	File TF pro hac vice
184897	Hours Worked	7/1/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with Elaine H. re Consent Decree; emails with R. Wendell re same
184977	Hours Worked	7/1/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Waiver of service research; telephone call with clerk
185027	Hours Worked	7/1/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Team emails re press inquiry
185054	Hours Worked	7/1/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Complete waiver of service form, send to opposing counsel
185120	Hours Worked	7/1/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	ECF filing - Waiver of service
185183	Hours Worked	7/2/2021	0.8	Tom Murphy	Misc communications with clients, team re filing status, press; emails re re-wording of Preliminary Approval motion
185549	Hours Worked	7/7/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with clerk; emails re appearance, hearing date
186302	Hours Worked	7/13/2021	0.7	Tom Murphy	Emails re press release; emails with MM re press; telephone call with WBZ reporter
186550	Hours Worked	7/14/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails re notice tasks
186642	Hours Worked	7/15/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with MM; email plaintiffs re fairness hearing

ID	Type	Date	Elapsed Time	User	Description
186970	Hours Worked	7/19/2021	1.2	Tom Murphy	Work on contact list for class notice
187355	Hours Worked	7/20/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Emails with MS, MM re class notice contacts
187671	Hours Worked	7/21/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Misc emails with co-counsel, Notice recipients, Ken S., Dan S.
188195	Hours Worked	7/27/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails re class notice, posting to website
188299	Hours Worked	7/29/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Emails re fee petition; emails w/ AG re timesheets, spreadsheet
189184	Hours Worked	8/5/2021	1	Tom Murphy	Review, edit time records spreadsheet
189249	Hours Worked	8/5/2021	1.2	Tom Murphy	Draft declaration in support of fee petition
189310	Hours Worked	8/5/2021	0.5	Tom Murphy	Review draft Plaintiff service award declarations and emails to Plaintiffs re same with instructions
189468	Hours Worked	8/6/2021	0.8	Tom Murphy	Finalize draft declaration re fees; email TP for approval
189485	Hours Worked	8/9/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Emails and telephone calls with Plaintiffs re service award petitions
189645	Hours Worked	8/10/2021	0.2	Tom Murphy	Finalize draft declaration based on TP edits; Email to co-counsel
189871	Hours Worked	8/11/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Telephone calls with two class members re their settlement questions; Emails with co-counsel to report back
190929	Hours Worked	8/18/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Telephone calls with plaintiffs to finalize service award declarations
191095	Hours Worked	8/18/2021	0.4	Tom Murphy	Finalize declarations of E.Hamilton, C.Evans, M.Muehe; e-mails with co-counsel re same
191185	Hours Worked	8/20/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Review and make comments re Plaintiff's motion for attorney's fees
191285	Hours Worked	8/25/2021	0.3	Tom Murphy	Telephone call with Colleen Flanagan and finalize service award declaration
	TM total		170.9		